
 

SPECIAL CITY COUNCIL MEETING  
Thursday, December 21, 2017 

7:30 p.m. 
CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS 
680 Park Avenue 
Idaho Falls, ID  83402 

Thank you for your interest in City Government. If you wish to express your thoughts on a matter listed below, please 
contact Councilmembers by email or personally before the meeting. Public testimony on agenda items will not be taken 
unless a hearing is indicated. Be aware that an amendment to this agenda may be made upon passage of a motion that 
states the reason for the amendment and the good faith reason that the agenda item was not included in the original 
agenda posting. Regularly-scheduled City Council Meetings are live streamed at www.idahofallsidaho.gov, then archived 
on the city website. If you need communication aids or services or other physical accommodations to participate or access 
this meeting, please contact City Clerk Kathy Hampton at 612-8414 or the ADA Coordinator Lisa Farris at 612-8323 as soon 
as possible and they will accommodate your needs. 

  

1. Call to Order. 
 

2. Pledge of Allegiance. 
 
3. Public Comment.  Members of the public are invited to address the City Council regarding matters 
that are not on this agenda or already noticed for a public hearing. When you address the Council, please state 
your name and address for the record and please limit your remarks to three (3) minutes. Please note that 
matters currently pending before the Planning Commission or Board of Adjustment which may be the subject of 
a pending enforcement action, or which are relative to a City personnel matter are not suitable for public 
comment. 
 

4. Consent Agenda.  Any item may be removed from the Consent Agenda at the request of any member 
of the Council for separate consideration.  
  

A. Items from Municipal Services: 
 

1) Bid IF-18-I, Bucket Truck with Articulating Telescopic Aerial Device  
 
2) Bid IF-18-H, Pickup with Tommy Gate and Snow Plow  
 
3) Bid IF-18-H, Replacement Vehicles for Various Departments 
 

B. Items from the City Clerk: 
 

1) Canvass of the Vote from the December 5, 2017 Runoff Election 
 

2) License Applications, including Beer Licenses to 3’s Company Catering, A Little Bit of Mexico, 
“A” Street Soup Market, Bear & Blue, Bee’s Knees Pub & Catering, Black Rock Fine Wine & 
Craft Beer, Blue Hashi, Café Mike’s at Pinecrest, Café Mike’s at Sage Lakes, Café Mike’s at Sand 
Creek, D’Railed, Frosty Gator, GR Bar on Easy Street, Golden Crown Lounge, Keefer’s Island, 
Kool Beanz Café, Krung Thep, Los Albertos, Los Panchos, Mackenzie River Pizza, Marcellar’s, 
Morenitas, Muddy’s Place, Outback Steakhouse, Papa Tom’s Pizza, Puerto Vallarta-Anderson, 
Quick Stop of Idaho Falls, Short Stop Market, Sizzler, Smith’s Food & Drug, Stockman’s, 
Sunnyside Travel, Tandoori Oven, Tom’s Gyro & Burgers, Westbank, and, Wrangler Roast Beef 
& Ham, all carrying the required approvals. 
 

http://www.idahofallsidaho.gov/


 
 

Page 2 of 4 

 

RECOMMENDD ACTION: To approve, accept, or receive all items on the Consent Agenda 
according to the recommendations presented (or take other action deemed appropriate). 
 

5. Regular Agenda.  
 

A. Human Resources 
 

1) Vote on Collective Bargaining Unit for Police:  As a follow-up to discussions held over the past 
several months, the Human Resources Department respectfully requests that City Council consider 
and vote on whether to approve or deny recognizing the Fraternal Order of Police as the collective 
bargaining unit for the Idaho Falls Police Department. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION:  To approve or deny recognizing the Fraternal Order of Police as the 
collective bargaining unit for the Idaho Falls Police Department (or take other action deemed 
appropriate). 

 
B. Municipal Services 

 
 1) Ordinance Amending Title 2, Chapter 9, Committee Name Change: Municipal Services 

requests City Council authorization to amend Title 2, Chapter 9, to rename the Civic Auditorium 
Committee to the Idaho Falls Civic Center for the Performing Arts Committee. This request is 
pursuant to the approval of the name change during the November 9, 2017 City Council meeting. 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION:  To approve the Ordinance amending Title 2, Chapter 9, under the 
suspension of the rules requiring three complete and separate readings and that it be read by title 
and published by summary (or consider the Ordinance on the first reading and that it be read by 
title, or reject the Ordinance). 

 
C. Fire Department  

 
 1) Physio Control Service Plan:  For consideration is the annual service plan from Physio Control 

for Like Pak 15 Monitors and Lucas Devices. The total plan is for $91,170.00 and is reflected in the 
2017/2018 budget. 

 
 RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the annual service plan from Physio Control, and give 

authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents (or take other 
action deemed appropriate). 

 
 2) Resolution for Firefighter and Peace Officer Hiring:  For consideration is a resolution that 

provides the ability for the Fire and Police Departments to hire Firefighters and Peace Officers 
early when conducting a new recruit academy and when there are personnel giving a letter of 
intent to retire. This will provide a more cost efficient program to hire when there are vacancies 
through retirement or resignation. 

 
 RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the Resolution for Firefighter and Peace Officer Hiring, and 

give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents (or take other 
action deemed appropriate). 

 
D. Idaho Falls Power 



 
 

Page 3 of 4 

 

 1) Approve a Memorandum of Understanding with PacifiCorp Related to Transmission 
Construction:  Idaho Falls Power and PacifiCorp DBA Rocky Mountain Power collocate distribution 
and transmission circuits on common pole lines where possible in and around the City. The two 
utilities are working together to identify projects that will enhance reliability in eastern Idaho. For 
consideration is a Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) which commits both parties to continue 
working towards Definitive Agreement(s) on the matters identified in the MOU by March 31, 2018.    

 
 RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the Memorandum of Understanding with PacifiCorp, and 

give authorization for the Mayor to execute the necessary documents (or take other action 
deemed appropriate). 

 
E. Community Development Services 

 
 1) Public Hearing – Ordinance to Adopt 2015 I-Codes: As discussed in the December 11, 2017 

Work Session, the Building Division has recommended adoption of the 2015 editions of the 
International Building Codes. This is a deviation from the State of Idaho’s adoption of only some of 
the 2015 codes, while keeping with some of the 2012 editions. Adopting all of the 2015 editions 
makes for a more consistent process for contractors. 

 
 RECOMMENDED ACTION:  To approve the Ordinance adopting the 2015 I-Codes under the 

suspension of the rules requiring three complete and separate readings and that it be read by title 
and published by summary (or consider the Ordinance on the first reading and that it be read by 
title, or reject the Ordinance). 

 
F. Public Works 

 
1) Speed Limit Resolution – Rollandet Avenue from 21st Street to Sunnyside Road: For 
consideration is a Resolution to establish a speed limit of 35 miles per hour (mph) on Rollandet 
Avenue from 21st Street to Sunnyside Road. The speed limit on this portion of Rollandet Avenue 
historically changes between 25 mph in the summer and 35 mph for the remainder of the year. 
The Traffic Safety Committee considered and recommended establishing a consistent year around 
speed limit of 35 mph at its June 13th, 2017 meeting. 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION:  To approve the Resolution to establish a speed limit of 35 mph on 
Rollandet Avenue from 21st Street to Sunnyside Road (or take other action deemed appropriate). 

 
2) Speed Limit Resolution – South Boulevard from Northgate Mile to Sunnyside Road: For 
consideration is a Resolution to establish a speed limit of 30 mph on South Boulevard from 
Northgate Mile to Sunnyside Road. Public Works intends to complete a number of construction 
projects within these limits of South Boulevard in 2018 and has determined that a speed limit of 30 
mph would be reasonable and prudent. Currently, South Boulevard has a posted speed limit of 25 
mph between Northgate Mile and 17th Street and 35 mph between 17th Street and Sunnyside 
Road. If approved, the proposed speed limit will be re-evaluated after implementation to 
determine if any changes need to be considered. 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION:  To approve the Resolution to establish a speed limit of 30 mph on South 
Boulevard from Northgate Mile to Sunnyside Road (or take other action deemed appropriate). 

 



 
 

Page 4 of 4 

 

3) Speed Limit Resolution – South Holmes Avenue from East 17th Street to East Sunnyside 
Road:  For consideration is a Resolution to establish a speed limit of 40 mph on South Holmes 
Avenue from East 17th Street to East Sunnyside Road. The speed limit on this portion of South 
Holmes Avenue is currently 35 mph. The Traffic Safety Committee considered this speed increase 
on December 12th, 2017 and recommended increasing the posted speed limit to 40 mph. 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION:  To approve the Resolution to establish a speed limit of 40 mph on South 
Holmes Avenue from East 17th Street to East Sunnyside Road (or take other action deemed 
appropriate). 

 
4) Speed Limit Resolution – John Adams Parkway from 25th East (Hitt Road) to South Holmes 
Avenue:  For consideration is a Resolution to establish a speed limit of 30 mph on John Adams 
Parkway from 25th East (Hitt Road) to South Holmes Avenue. The speed limit on this portion of 
John Adams Parkway is currently 25 mph. The Traffic Safety Committee considered this speed 
increase on December 12th, 2017 and recommended against increasing the posted speed limit to 
30 mph. The committee vote was tied and the duty of the final decision then defaulted to the 
chairperson. The chairperson voted against increasing the posted speed limit. 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION:  To approve the Resolution to establish a speed limit of 30 mph on John 
Adams Parkway from 25th East (Hitt Road) to South Holmes Avenue (or take other action deemed 
appropriate). 

 

6. Motion to Adjourn. 

















































P
R

E
C

IN
C

T

R
E

B
E

C
C

A
 C

A
S

P
E

R

B
A

R
B

A
R

A
 E

H
A

R
D

T

01 149 108 01 1026 4 1030 257 24.95%

02 120 89 02 1029 8 1037 209 20.15%

03 64 61 03 588 0 588 125 21.26%

04 185 97 04 951 4 955 282 29.53%

05 92 138 05 891 5 896 230 25.67%

06 189 133 06 945 1 946 322 34.04%

07 99 115 07 987 14 1001 214 21.38%

08/38 230 87 08/38 944 8 952 317 33.30%

09 97 97 09 1151 2 1153 194 16.83%

10 121 146 10 1105 13 1118 267 23.88%

11 170 106 11 1094 10 1104 276 25.00%

12 154 144 12 1004 5 1009 300 29.73%

13 139 84 13 1111 3 1114 223 20.02%

14 139 83 14 836 8 844 222 26.30%

15 226 156 15 1180 4 1184 382 32.26%

16 220 149 16 1121 6 1127 369 32.74%

17 196 134 17 1119 9 1128 330 29.26%

18 174 112 18 1134 2 1136 287 25.26%

19 231 120 19 983 4 987 351 35.56%

20 97 73 20 1063 6 1069 171 16.00%

21 118 132 21 1035 5 1040 250 24.04%

22 5 1 22 41 1 42 6 14.29%

23 72 39 23 431 2 433 111 25.64%

24 217 105 24 1129 5 1134 322 28.40%

25 189 128 25 954 5 959 317 33.06%

26 160 138 26 1044 11 1055 298 28.25%

27 89 97 27 762 5 767 186 24.25%

46 29 42 46 278 3 281 71 25.27%

Absentee 1333 503 Absentee 1837

TOTAL 5304 3417 TOTAL 25936 153 26089 8726 33.45%

%
 o

f 
R

e
g
is

te
re

d
 V

o
te

rs
 t
h
a
t 
V

o
te

d

BONNEVILLE COUNTY RESULTS

DECEMBER 05, 2017 RUNOFF ELECTION

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS VOTING STATISTICS

MAYOR

4 Year Term

P
R

E
C

IN
C

T

T
o
ta

l 
N

u
m

b
e
r 

o
f 
R

e
g
is

te
re

d
 V

o
te

rs
 

a
t 
C

u
to

ff

N
u
m

b
e
r 

o
f 
E

le
c
ti
o
n
 D

a
y
 

R
e
g
is

tr
a
ti
o
n
s

T
o
ta

l 
N

u
m

b
e
r 

o
f 
R

e
g
is

te
re

d
 V

o
te

rs

N
u
m

b
e
r 

o
f 
B

a
llo

ts
 C

a
s
t





 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
As a follow-up to discussions held over the past several months, the Human Resources Department 
respectfully requests that in its December 21, 2017 meeting, the City Council considers and votes on 
whether to approve or deny recognizing the Fraternal Order of Police as the collective bargaining unit 
for the Idaho Falls Police Department. 
 
COUNCIL AGENDA ACTION: Approve or deny recognizing the Fraternal Order of Police as the 
collective bargaining unit for the Idaho Falls Police Department. 
 

Ryan Tew, Human Resource Department Director 

Vote on Collective Bargaining Unit for Police 

Honorable Mayor and City Council 

December 12, 2017 





























HIRING AND TRAINING OF FIRST RESPONDERS   PAGE 1 OF 3 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 2017- 

 
A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A MUNICIPAL 
CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, AUTHORIZING THE HIRING 
AND TRAINING OF NEW FIREFIGHTERS AND PEACE OFFICERS TO 
REPLACE VACANCIES CREATED BY RETIRING OR RESIGNING 
FIREFIGHTERS AND PEACE OFFICERS; AND PROVIDING THAT THIS 
RESOLUTION BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND INSTALLATION 
OF APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE. 

 
WHEREAS, the City provides full fire, police, and ambulance services for members of the 
community at a professional and efficient level; and  
 
WHEREAS, the primary reason for the Fire and Police Departments’ respective abilities to 
function is due to its trained workforce and staffing levels; and 
 
WHEREAS, a number of firefighters and peace officers who have served the City for many years 
are retiring; and 
 
WHEREAS, other firefighters and peace officers leave City employment for various reasons; and  
 
WHEREAS, citizens are benefitted by a predictable and appropriately staffed first responder 
services; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Fire and Police Departments wish to continue their professional and predictable 
employment program, when possible; and 
 
WHEREAS, approximately four (4) months are required to hire and adequately train new 
firefighters; and 
 
WHEREAS, approximately four-and-a-half (41 2⁄ ) to eight (8) months are required to hire and 
adequately train new peace officers; and 
 
WHEREAS, during the hiring and training period, current firefighters are paid for back fill at 
double the normal rate; and 
 
WHEREAS, during the hiring and training period, the Police Department must rearrange shifts 
and on- and off-duty time, many times at a rate in excess of the normal police officer paid rate; 
and  
 
WHEREAS, lower staffing rates may affect staffing levels to the potential detriment of first 
response; and  



HIRING AND TRAINING OF FIRST RESPONDERS   PAGE 2 OF 3 

 

 
WHEREAS being allowed to hire and train firefighters and peace officers beginning upon 
notification of departure from the fire service will save time and money and will sustain 
appropriate staffing levels; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Council supports fire service and Police Department efficiencies wherever 
possible. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, AS FOLLOWS: 

1. The Council authorizes the Idaho Falls Fire Department to immediately hire and train 
(including new hire participation in a fire academy) firefighters for every vacancy created 
when a firefighter gives written notice to the Fire Chief of intent to retire or resign. 
 

2. The Council authorizes the Idaho Falls Police Department to immediately hire and train 
(including new hire participation in a Police Officer Standards and Training Course 
(P.O.S.T)) peace officers for every vacancy created when a peace officer gives written 
notice to the Police Chief of intent to retire or resign. 

 
3. Such hiring and training can commence at any time within the three-month period 

preceding the date of planned retirement or resignation from fire service or Police 
Department employment. 

 
ADOPTED and effective this ____ day of December, 2017. 

 

      CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO 

 

      _________________________________ 

      Rebecca L. Noah Casper, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

_________________________ 

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk 

(SEAL) 

 

 



HIRING AND TRAINING OF FIRST RESPONDERS   PAGE 3 OF 3 

 

STATE OF IDAHO  ) 

    ) ss: 

County of Bonneville  ) 

 

I, KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, DO 
HEREBY CERTIFY: 

 

That the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of the Resolution 
entitled, “A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A 
MUNICIPAL CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, AUTHORIZING 
THE HIRING AND TRAINING OF NEW FIREFIGHTERS AND PEACE 
OFFICERS TO REPLACE VACANCIES CREATED BY RETIRING OR 
RESIGNING FIREFIGHTERS AND PEACE OFFICERS; AND PROVIDING 
THAT THIS RESOLUTION BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND 
INSTALLATION OF APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE.” 
 

     

      ____________________________ 

      Kathy Hampton, City Clerk 

(SEAL) 



 

  
 
 
  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Idaho Falls Power accepts delivery of its power supply at two points of delivery that are 
interconnected to PacifiCorp. Additionally, Idaho Falls Power and PacifiCorp doing business as 
Rocky Mountain Power collocate distribution and transmission circuits on common pole lines 
where possible in and around the City to minimize encumbrances on the public right-of-way. 
 
The two utilities are working together to identify projects that will enhance reliability in eastern 
Idaho, a strategic area of focus identified in the newly adopted Idaho Falls Strategic Plan. The 
attached Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) commits both parties to continue working 
towards Definitive Agreement(s) on the matters identified in the MOU by March 31, 2018. The 
City Attorney has reviewed the MOU. 

 
Idaho Falls Power respectfully requests City Council approve the Memorandum of 
Understanding with PacifiCorp and authorize the Mayor to sign the document. 
 
Attachment 
 
C: City Attorney 
 City Clerk 
 File 
 
JRF/984 

 
 
 

Honorable Mayor Casper & City Council 

Jackie Flowers, General Manager 
December 18, 2017 
Approve a Memorandum of Understanding with PacifiCorp related to transmission 
construction 



 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 As discussed in the last work session, the Building Division has recommended adoption of the 
2015 editions of the International Building Codes.  This is a deviation from the State of Idaho’s 
adoption of only some of the 2015 codes, while keeping with some of the 2012 editions.  
Adopting all of the 2015 editions makes for a more consistent process for contractors.  Staff 
recommends approval of the ordinance.  
 
Attachments: Letter and report from Reginald Fuller, Building Official 
 Ordinance Adopting 2015 Codes  
 
 
 

Honorable Mayor and Council  

Brad Cramer, Community Development Services Director 
December 14, 2017 
Ordinance to Adopt 2015 i-Codes.  





City of Idaho Falls 

Adoption of 2015 I‐Codes 

With 

AMENDMENTS 

 

 

1. Adoption of the 2015 International Residential Code Subject to the City of Idaho Falls 

amendments shall be as follows: 

 

a. Delete exception No. 1 contained under IRC section R101.2 ‐ Scope. 

 

b. Delete exception No. 2 contained under IRC section R101.2 ‐ Scope, and replace with the following: 

Owner‐occupied  lodging  houses  with  five  (5)  or  fewer  guestrooms  shall  be  permitted  to  be 

constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One‐ and Two‐family Dwellings.  

 

c.  Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 ‐ Work exempt 

from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than 

four (4) feet (one thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep. 

 

d. Add the following item No. 11 at the end of the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 ‐ Work 

exempt from permit: Flag poles. 

 

e. Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For construction 

in areas prone  to  flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of  the  lowest  floor, 

including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the 

elevation of the lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322. 

 

f. Table  R301.2(1)  of  the  International  Residential  Code,  2012  Edition,  shall  be  amended  to  read  as 

follows: 

TABLE R301.2 (1) 

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA 
 

 
 

 

 



Page 2 

 

 

g. IRC Table R302.1 (1) Exterior Walls ‐‐ delete the figures contained in the last column of the table under 

the  heading Minimum  Fire  Separation  Distance  for  the  “Walls”  and  “Projections”  elements,  and 

replace with the following:    

 

     
 

h.  Delete  the  items 1 & 2  contained under  IRC  section R302.2  ‐‐  Townhouses,  and  replace with  the 

following: Exception: A common two hour or  two (2) one‐hour  fire resistance rated wall assembly 

tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses  if such walls do not 

contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall 

shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides and shall extend to and be tight against the exterior 

walls  and  the  underside  of  the  roof  sheathing.  Penetrations  of  electrical  outlet  boxes  shall  be  in 

accordance with section R302.4.  

 

i. Delete IRC section R303.4 and replace with the following: R303.4 Mechanical Ventilation. Dwelling 

units shall be provided with whole‐house mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section M1507.3 

 

j. Delete  the  exception  contained  under  IRC  section  R313.1  ‐‐  Townhouse  automatic  fire  sprinkler 

systems, and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall 

not  be  required  in  townhouses  where  a  two‐hour  fire‐resistance  rated  wall  is  installed  between 

dwelling units or when additions or alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an 

automatic residential fire sprinkler system installed. (3‐29‐10) 

 

k. Delete IRC section R313.2. 

 

l.  Add the following to IRC section R315.2.2 ‐ Where required in existing dwellings: Exceptions: 

1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as, but not limited to, replacement 

of roofing or siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of 

a porch or deck or electrical permits, are exempt from the requirements of this section. 

 

m.  Delete IRC section R322.1.10. 

 

 



Page 3 

 

 

 

n. Delete IRC section R322.2.2 subparagraph 2.1, and replace with the following: The total net area of all 

openings shall be at least one (1) square inch (645 mm2) for each square foot (0.093 m2) of enclosed 

area, or the opening shall be designed and the construction documents shall include a statement that 

the design and installation of the openings will provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on 

exterior walls by allowing the automatic entry and exit of floodwaters. 

 

 

o. IRC Table R403.1(1) & (2) Min. Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings‐replace with the following: 

 

 

 

p. The  exception  to  Section  R405.1  of  the  International  Residential  Code,  2015  Edition,  is  hereby 

amended to read as follows: 

Exception: A drainage system is not required when the foundation is installed on well‐drained ground 

or sand‐gravel mixture soils according to the Unified Soil Classification System, Group I and Group II 

Soils, as detailed in Table R405.1. 

 

q. An exception to Section N1103.3.5 shall be added as follows: 

                          Exception: Building‐framing cavities used as ducts or plenums shall comply with Section M1601.1.1. 

 

r. Table N1102.2.2 (Table R402.1.2) shall be amended to read as follows:  

 



 

Page 4 

 

 

Table N1102.1.2 

  

s. The 2018 International Residential Code (RB229‐16) shall modify table R602.7.5 of the International 

Residential Code, 2015 Edition. 

t. Delete IRC section R602.10 and replace with the following: Wall bracing. Buildings shall be braced in 

accordance with this section or, when applicable section R602.12, or the most current edition of APA 

System Report SR‐102 as an alternate method. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply 

with one (1) or more of the bracing requirements in this section, those portions shall be designated 

and constructed in accordance with section R301.1. 

 

u. Delete requirement for special inspections in Section R606.3.5. 

 

 

2. Adoption of  the 2015  International Energy Conservation Code subject  to City of  Idaho 

Falls amendments shall be as follows: 

 
a. An exception to Section R403.3.5 shall be added as follows: 

    Exception: Building‐framing cavities used as ducts or plenums shall comply with Section M1601.1.1 (IRC). 

b. Delete Wood Frame Wall R‐value contained  in Table R402.1.2 (N1102.1.2)  for climate zone “6” and 

replace with the following: 

 

Table 402.1.2 

Insulation and fenestration Requirements By Componenta 



 
 

 

 

 

c. Add  the  following  as  section  402.4.1.3  (N1102.4.1.3):  Visual  inspection  option,  Building  envelope 

tightness  and  insulation  installation  shall  be  considered  acceptable when  the  items  listed  in  Table 

402.4.1.1, applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. Where required by code official 

an approved party  independent  from the  installer of  the  insulation shall  inspect  the air barrier and 

insulation.  

 

d. Delete Section R402.4.4.  

 

 

 

Page 5 

In accordance with the Idaho State Building Board, as published in Idaho Statute, Title 39, Chapter 41 of 

the  Idaho Building Code Act,  Idaho Code 39‐4116 for  local government adoption   and enforcement of 

building codes and in IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety”, Division of Building Safety. 

3. Adoption of the 2015 International Building Code with State Amendments 

 

a. Delete section 305.2.3 and replace with the following: Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling 

unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children 

receiving  such day  care  shall  be  classified as a Group R‐3 occupancy or  shall  comply with  the 

International Residential Code. (3‐20‐14) 

 

b. Delete section 308.6.4 and replace with the following: Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A 

facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving 

day care or having five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group 

R‐3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. (3‐20‐14) 

 

c.  Delete section 310.5 and replace with the following: Residential Group R‐3. Residential Group R‐

3 occupancies where the occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group 

R‐1, R‐2, R‐4, E or I, including: (3‐29‐17) 



 

i. Buildings that do not contain more than two (2) dwelling units; 

ii. Boarding houses (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; 

iii. Boarding houses (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; 

iv. Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care; 

v. Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; 

vi. Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; or 

Page 6 

 

 

 

vii. Dwelling units providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer children. 

viii. Lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guest rooms. 

 

d. Delete  section  310.5.1  and  replace  with  the  following:  Care  facilities  within  a  dwelling.  Care 

facilities  for  twelve  (12)  or  fewer  children  receiving  day  care  or  for  five  (5)  or  fewer  persons 

receiving  care  that  are  within  a  single‐family  dwelling  are  permitted  to  comply  with  the 

International Residential Code. (3‐20‐14) 

 

e. Add  footnote  (f)  in  the header  row of  the  table  column  labeled  “Drinking Fountains” of Table 

2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures, and add footnote (f) under Table 2902.1 

to state the following: Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or 

fewer. (3‐29‐17) 

 

 

f. Delete  footnote  (e)  contained  under  Table  2902.1  Minimum  Number  of  Required  Plumbing 

Fixtures  and  replace with  the  following:  For  business  occupancies,  excluding  restaurants,  and 

mercantile occupancies with an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be 

required. (3‐29‐17) 

 

4. Adoption of the 2015 International Mechanical Code 

 
a. International Mechanical Code Adopted: The International Mechanical Code 2012  2015 Edition, published by the 

International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as an official Code of the City, except the portions deleted, 
modified or amended by the provisions of this Chapter. 
 

b. Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Mechanical Code, 2012 2015 Edition, shall be retained by the City 
Clerk for use and examination by the public. (Ord. 2318, 3-25-99; Ord. 2476, 12-19-02; Ord. 2569, 12-09-04; Ord. 
2726, 11-20-07; Ord. 2857, 12-16-10) 

 



 

 

 

 

 

Page 7 

 

4A. Adoption of the 2015 International Mechanical Code subject to the City of Idaho 

Falls amendments shall be as follows: 

a. Section 103.2 of the International Mechanical Code 2012  2015 Edition, shall be amended to read as follows:  
 
103.2 Appointment. The Code Official shall be appointed by the chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.  

 
b.  Section 109.1 of the International Mechanical Code, 2012 2015 Edition, shall be amended to read as follows:  

 
109.1 Application for appeal. A person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the code official to the board of 
appeals. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally 
adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted. The application shall be filed on a form obtained from the 
code official within twenty (20) days after the notice was served. (Ord. 2318, 3-25-99; Ord. 2476, 12-19-02; Ord. 
2569, 12-09-04; Ord. 2726, 11-20-07; Ord. 2857, 12-16-10) 

 
 
5. Adoption of the 2012 Fuel Gas Code 

 
a. International Fuel Gas Code Adopted: The International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 2015 Edition, published by the 

International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as an official Code of the City, except the portions deleted, 
modified or amended by the provisions of this Chapter.  
 

b. Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 2015 Edition, shall be retained by the City 
Clerk for use and examination by the public. (Ord. 2319, 3-25-99; Ord. 2477, 12-19-02; Ord. 2570, 12-09-04; Ord. 
2727, 11-20-07; Ord. 2856, 12-16-10) 

 
 

6.  Adoption of the 2012 International Fuel Gas Code subject to the City of Idaho Falls amendments 

shall be as follows: 

 
a. Section 103.2 of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 2012 Edition, shall be amended to read as follows:  

 
103.2Appointment. The code official shall be appointed by the chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.  
 
b. Section 109.1 of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 2012 Edition, shall be amended to read as follows:  

 



109.1 Application for appeal. A person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the code official to the board of appeals. 
An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder, 
have been incorrectly interpreted. The application shall be filed on a form obtained from the code official within twenty 
(20) days after the notice was served.  

 
7. Adoption of the 2015 International Property Maintenance Code subject to the City of 

Idaho Falls amendments are as follows: 
 
a.  Section 111.1 Application for appeal, of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2012 

2015 Edition, shall be amended to read as follows: 
 
 

111.1 Application for appeal. Any person directly affected by a decision of the Code official or a 

notice  or  order  issued  under  this  Code  shall  have  the  right  to  appeal  to  the  board  of  appeals, 

provided  that  written  application  for  appeal  is  filed  within  twenty  (20)  days  after  the  day  the 

decision, notice or order was served. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the 

true intent of this Code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted. 

 

8. Adoption of the 2015 International Existing Building Code. 

 

a. International Existing Building Code Adopted. The  International Existing Building Code  (2012 

2015 Edition), published by the International Code Council, Inc. is hereby adopted as an official 

code of the City. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
 
 

 

  Good Cause to adopt the 2015 International Residential Code 

Pursuant to Idaho State Statute Title 39 Chapter 41 section 39‐4116(4)(b), the City of Idaho Falls finds good cause to adopt 

the 2015 International Building Code (IRC) amending the state statute to remain in the 2012 edition of the IRC. 

The attempts to adopt the 2015 International Residential Code by the Idaho Building Code board has been unsuccessful. 

With no compromise, primarily due to the residential provisions of the energy code, which replicates the energy provisions 

within the IRC, no further effort was made to adopt the 2015 edition of the IRC at the state level. Rather, the focus has 

been to start looking at the 2018 edition of the IRC with the hopes of adopting in within 2 to 3 years. The City of Idaho 

Falls currently adopts the 2012 edition of the IRC, therefore, adopting the 2015 edition would maintain the typical code 

cycle by the International Code Council of updating the code every 3 years. 

Benefits of Adopting the Updated Code: 

1. Cost savings: 

a. Fire blocking allowed in lieu of fire rated soffits at exterior walls close to property lines. 

b. Less restrictive size for lag screws for deck ledgers. 

c. Less restrictive braced wall panel ratios in Seismic Design Category C. 

d. Reduction of load capacity for portal frame hold‐down straps, contributing length increased to 50%. 

2. Options & Flexibility: 

a. Accessory buildings no longer limited to 2 stories or 3,000 s.f. in area. 

b. Habitable room size reduced to 70 sq. ft. 

c. Reduction in the ceiling heights for bathrooms and laundry rooms. 

d. Mezzanines allowed without being counted as a story or 2nd. Floor. 

e. Fastening schedule now allows multiple nail size options for roof, wall and floor. 

3. New products and Technology: 

a. Standard for locating smoke alarms near cooking appliances and bathrooms. 

b. Provisions for alternating tread device and ship ladders added to the code. 

c. New siding materials, insulated vinyl siding and polypropylene siding in the code. 

d. Provisions for photovoltaic roof shingles & rooftop mounted photovoltaic systems. 

4. Consistency with companion codes: 

a. 2015 IRC directly correlates with the language and code sections of the other adopted I‐codes for compatibility 

and consistency. 

5. Insurance Rating: 

a. Maintains up to date codes for insurance underwriting and rating purposes in accordance with the Building 

Code Effectiveness Grading Schedule (BCEGS) Survey for the Idaho Surveying & Rating Bureau. 

 

Recommendation: 

It is recommended that the City Council approve the adoption of the 2015 International Residential Code with 

those amendments as outlined in the purposed ordinance. For the reasons and benefits as noted above, it 

both reasonable and prudent for the City of Idaho Falls to adopt the latest update to the International Building 

Code. This will ensure that the City of Idaho Falls has adopted the most current and comprehensive codes for 

its citizens. 

 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 1 OF 14 
 

 
ORDINANCE NO. _________ 

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, AMENDING 
TITLE 7 ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2015 EDITIONS OF THE 
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 
MAINTENANCE CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION 
CODE; ADOPTING THE 2015 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
EXISTING BUILDING CODE; PROVIDING SEVERABILITY, 
CODIFICATION, PUBLICATION BY SUMMARY, AND ESTABLISHING 
EFFECTIVE DATE. 

 
WHEREAS, various uniform international codes have been adopted by the State that regulate 
structures and structural components’; and 
 
WHEREAS, such codes are adopted to promote safety by requiring that certain building and 
maintenance standards be applied to habitable structures; and 
 
WHEREAS, the State allows municipalities to make certain limited amendments to such codes 
in order to accommodate local conditions and concerns as long as such local amendments are 
equivalent to or at least as stringent as State Code provisions; and 
 
WHEREAS, City staff has reviewed the currently adopted uniform international State Codes, 
along with the State’s amendments to such Codes and recommends, by the Ordinance, certain 
further, local amendments; and 
 
WHEREAS, City Code amendments contained herein are necessary, are based upon local needs 
and desires, conform with the purposes and aims of the relevant State Codes, as amended, and 
are equivalent or at least as stringent as their companion State Codes; and 
 
WHEREAS, the adoption of these local amendments are in the best interest of the community 
served by the City Codes referenced herein. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, THAT: 
 
SECTION 1. Title 7, Chapter 1, of the City Code of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, is hereby 
amended as follows: 
 
7-1-1: INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE ADOPTED:  
 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 2 OF 14 
 

(A) International Building Code Adopted: The International Building Code, 20152 Edition, 
published by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as an official code of the City, 
except the portions deleted, modified or amended by the provisions of this Chapter.  
 
(B) Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Building Code, 20152 Edition, shall be retained 
by the City Clerk for use and examination by the public.  
 
7-1-2: AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE:  
 
(A) A new Section, Section 101.2.2, Scope, shall be added to the International Building Code, 
20152 Edition, as follow:  

 
101.2.2 Scope. The provisions of this Code shall serve as the administrative, organizational 
and enforcement rules and regulations for the technical codes which regulate site 
preparation and construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair, use and occupancy of 
buildings, structures and building service equipment within this jurisdiction. If there is any 
conflict between the International Building Code, 20125 Edition, and any other technical 
code, the International Building Code, 20125 Edition, shall control.  

 
(B) Section 101.4.4, Plumbing, of the International Building Code, 20152 Edition, shall be 
amended to read as follows:  
 

101.4.4 Plumbing. The provisions of the Idaho State Plumbing Code shall apply to the 
installation, alterations, repairs and replacement of plumbing systems, including 
equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to a water 
or sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas system.  

 
(C) Section 104.6, Right of entry, of the International Building Code, 20152 Edition, shall be 
amended to read as follows:  
 

104.6 Right of entry. Where it is necessary to make an inspection to enforce the provisions 
of this Code, or where the building official has reasonable cause to believe that there exists 
in a structure or upon a premises a condition which is contrary to or in violation of this 
Code which makes the structure or premises unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the building 
official is authorized to enter the structure or premises at reasonable times to inspect or to 
perform the duties imposed by this Code, provided that if such structure or premises be 
occupied that credentials be presented to the occupant and entry requested. If such structure 
or premises is unoccupied, the building official shall first make a reasonable effort to locate 
the owner or other person having charge or control of the structure or premises and request 
entry. If entry is refused, or if the owner or person in control cannot be located, the building 
official shall have recourse to the remedies provided by law to secure entry.  

 
(D) Section 113.2, Limitations on authority, of the International Building Code, 20152 Edition, 
shall be amended to read as follows:  

 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 3 OF 14 
 

113.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the 
true intent of this Code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly 
interpreted, the provisions of this Code do not fully apply, or an equally good or better 
form of construction is proposed pursuant to the criteria set forth in section 104.11 of the 
International Building Code, 2012 Edition. The board shall have no authority to waive 
requirements of this Code.  

 
(E) Delete sSection 305.2.3 and replace with the followingshall be amended to read as follows:  

305.2.3. Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above 
within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving such day care 
shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International 
Residential Code.  

(F) Delete sSection 308.6.4 shall be amended to read as follows and replace with the following:  
 

308.6.4. Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a 
dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or having five 
(5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 
occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. 
 

(G) Delete sSection 310.5 and replace with the followingshall be amended to read as follows:  
 

310.5. Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3 occupancies where the occupants are 
primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4, E or I, including:  
 

i. Buildings that do not contain more than two (2) dwelling units; 
ii. Boarding houses (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; 
iii. Boarding houses (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; 
iv. Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (5) or fewer persons 

receiving care; 
v. Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer 

occupants; 
vi. Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; or 
vii. Dwelling units providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer children. 
viii. Lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guest rooms. 

(H) Delete sSection 310.5.1 and replace with the followingshall be amended to read as follows:  

310.5.1. Care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children 
receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care that are within a single-
family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code. 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 4 OF 14 
 

(EI) Chapter 29, Plumbing Systems of the International Building Code, 20152 Edition, shall be 
amended to read as follows:  
 
. . .  
 

Table 2902.1 Footnote “e” shall be amended to read as follows: 
 

e. For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies 
with an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, server sinks shall not be required. 

 
Table 2902.1 Footnote “f” shall be amended added to read as follows:  

 
f. Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer.  
 

Table 2902.1 Footnote “g” shall be amended added to read as follows:  
 
g. For business and mercantile occupancies with an occupant load of thirty (30) or 
fewer, service sinks shall not be required. 

 
(J) Table R602.7.5, Minimum Number of Full height studs at each end of header in exterior walls, shall 
be amended to read as follows: 
 

 
 
 
 
 

SECTION 2. Title 7, Chapter 2, of the City Code of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, is hereby 
amended as follows: 
 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 5 OF 14 
 

7-2-1: INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE ADOPTED:  
 
(A) International Property Maintenance Code Adopted: The International Property Maintenance 
Code, 20125 Edition, published by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as an 
official code of the City, except the portions deleted, modified, or amended by the provisions of 
this cChapter.  

 
(B) (B) Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Property Maintenance Code, 20125 

Edition, duly certified by the Clerk, shall be retained by the City Clerk for use and 
examination by the public.  

 
7-2-2: AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE:  
 
(A) Section 111.1 Application for appeal, of the International Property Maintenance Code, 20125 
Edition, shall be amended to read as follows:  
 

111.1 Application for appeal. Any person directly affected by a decision of the Code 
official or a notice or order issued under this Code shall have the right to appeal to the 
board of appeals, provided that written application for appeal is filed within twenty (20) 
days after the day the decision, notice or order was served. An application for appeal shall 
be based on a claim that the true intent of this Code or the rules legally adopted thereunder 
have been incorrectly interpreted. 

 

SECTION 3. Title 7, Chapter 4, of the City Code of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, is hereby 
amended as follows: 
 
7-4-1: INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE ADOPTED:  
 
(A) International Fuel Gas Code Adopted: The International Fuel Gas Code, 20125 Edition, 
published by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as an official Code of the 
City, except the portions deleted, modified, or amended by the provisions of this Chapter.  
 
(B) Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Fuel Gas Code, 20125 Edition, shall be 
retained by the City Clerk for use and examination by the public.  
 
7-4-2: AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE:  
 
(A) Section 103.2 of the International Fuel Gas Code, 20125 Edition, shall be amended to read as 
follows:  

 
103.2 Appointment. The code official shall be appointed by the chief appointing authority 
of the jurisdiction.  

 
(B) Section 109.1 of the International Fuel Gas Code, 20125 Edition, shall be amended to read as 
follows:  
 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 6 OF 14 
 

109.1 Application for appeal. A person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the 
code official to the board of appeals. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim 
that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder, have been 
incorrectly interpreted. The application shall be filed on a form obtained from the code 
official within twenty (20) days after the notice was served.  

 
(C) Sections 620.2 and 620.7 of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 Edition, are hereby 
deleted.  
 
SECTION 4. Title 7, Chapter 6, of the City Code of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, is hereby 
amended as follows: 
 
7-6-1: INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADOPTED:  
 
(A) International Residential Code Adopted: The International Residential Code for One and 
Two Family Dwellings, 20125 Edition, published by the International Code Council, Inc., 
including Appendix M, is hereby adopted as an official code of the City, except the portions 
deleted, modified and amended by the provisions of this Chapter.  
 
(B) Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Residential Code for One and Two Family 
Dwellings, 20125 Edition, shall be retained by the City Clerk for use and examination by the 
public.  
 
7-6-2: AMENDMENTS TO INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE:  
 
(A) The Eexceptions to Section R101.2, Scope,  of the International Residential Code, 2012 
Edition shall be amended to read as follows:  
 

Exceptions: Owner-occupied lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guestrooms shall be 
permitted to be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One- 
and Two-family dwellings.  

 
(B) Paragraph (1) of the “Building” section of Section R105.2, Work Exempt from Permit, shall 
be amended to read as follows:  
 

Building:  
 

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and 
similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet (18.58 m2).  
 
2. fences not over seven (7) feet (one thousand, eight hundred twenty-nine (1,829) mm) 
high may be exempted from the requirement for a building permit in the absence of any 
other  
 
3. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom 
of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.  



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 7 OF 14 
 

 
4. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 
gallons (18,927 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.  
 
5. Sidewalks and driveways.  
 
6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.  
 
7. Prefabricated swimming pools that are greater than four (4) feet (one thousand, two 
hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep.  
 
8. Swings and other playground equipment.  
 
9. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54 
inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.  
 
10. Decks not exceeding 200 square feet (18.58 m2) in area, that are not more than 30 
inches (762 mm) above grade at any point, are not attached to a dwelling and do not serve 
the exit door required by Section R311.4.  
 
11. Flag poles. 

 
. . . 
 
(F) The Exception to Section R302.2, Townhouses, shall be amended to read as follows:  

 
Exception: A common one-hour or two-hour fire resistance rated wall assembly tested in 
accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses is such walls do 
not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the 
common wall. The wall shall be rated of fire exposure from both sides and shall extended 
to and be tight against the exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. 
Penetration of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4. 
 

(G) Section R303.4, Mechanical ventilation, shall be amended to read as follows:  

 R303.4 Mechanical Ventilation. Dwelling units shall be provided with whole-house 
mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section M1507.3. 

. . . 
 
(IH) Section R313, Automatic Fire Suppression System, shall be deleted it its entirety.  
 
(I) Section R R315.3315.32.2, Where Required in Existing Dwellings, shall be amended and read 
as follows:  

 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 8 OF 14 
 

R315.3 Where required in existing dwellings. Where work requiring a permit occurs in 
existing dwellings that have attached garages or in existing dwellings within which 
fuelfired appliances exist, carbon monoxide alarms shall be provided in accordance with 
Section R315.1.  
 
Exceptions:  

 
1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as, but not limited to, 
replacement of roofing or siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or 
doors, or the addition of a porch or deck or electrical permits, are exempt from the 
requirements of this section; and  

  
2. Installation, alteration, or repairs of noncombustion plumbing or mechanical 
systems are exempt from the requirements of this section. 

 
(JJI) Section R322.1.10, As-built Elevation Documentation , of the International Residential 
Code, 2012 Edition, shall be deleted in its entirety.  
 
(KKJ) Subparagraph 2.2. of Section R322.2.2, Enclosed Area Below Design Flood Elevation, 
shall be amended to read as follows:  
 

R322.2.2. The total net area of all opening shall be at least one (1) square inch (645 mm2) 
for each square foot (.093 m2 ) of enclosed area, or the opening shall be designed and the 
construction documents shall include a state that the design and installation of the 
openings will provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by 
allowing the automatic entry and exit of floodwaters. 

 
(LK) IRC Table R403.1(1) & (2) Min. Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings- shall be 
replace with the following: 

 
 
(L) The Exception to Section R405.1, Concrete or Masonry Foundations, shall be amended to 
read as follows:  



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 9 OF 14 
 

 
Exception:  

 
A drainage system is not required when the foundation is installed on well-drained 
ground or sand-gravel mixture soils according to the Unified Soil Classification System, 
Group 1 and Group II soils, as detailed in Table R405.1. 

 
(M) Section R501.3, Fire Protection of Floors, and the exceptions to R501.3 shall be deleted in 
their entirety.  
 
(N) Section R602.10, Wall Bracing , of the International Residential Code, 2012 Edition, shall be 
amended to read as follows:  
 

R602.10 Wall Bracing. Buildings shall be braced in accordance with this section or, when 
applicable sectionR602.12, or the most current edition of APA System Report SR102 as 
an alternate method. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply with one (1) 
or more of the bracing requirements in this section, those portions shall be designated and 
constructed in accordance with section R301.1.  

 
(O) Section N1102.4.1.2. (R402.4.1.2) Testing, shall be amended to read as follows:  
 

N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing option. Building envelope tightness and insulation 
installation shall be considered acceptable when tested air leakage is less than five (5) air 
changes per hour (ACH) when tested with a blower door at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50 Pa). 
Testing shall occur after rough in and after installation of penetrations of the building 
envelope, including penetrations for utilities, plumbing, electrical, ventilation and 
combustion appliances. During testing:  
 

i. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove doors shall be closed, but not 
sealed;  

 
ii. Dampers shall be closed, but not sealed, including exhaust, intake, makeup air, 
backdraft and flue dampers;  

 
iii. Interior doors shall be open;  

 
iv. Exterior openings for continuous ventilation systems and heat recovery 

ventilators shall be closed and sealed;  
 

v. Heating and cooling system(s) shall be turned off;  
 

vi. HVAC ducts shall not be sealed; and  
 

vii. Supply and return registers shall not be sealed.  



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 10 OF 14 
 

 
(P) Subparagraph Section N1102.4.1.3. (R402.4.1.3) Visual Inspection Option, shall be amended 
to read as follows:  
 

N1102.4.1.3 (R402.4.1.3) Visual inspection option. Building envelope tightness and 
insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when the items listed in Table 
402.4.1.1, applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. Where required by 
code official an approved party independent from the installer of the insulation shall 
inspect the air barrier and insulation.  

 
(Q) The following section shall be added to the International Residential Code, 2012 Edition:  
 

N1103.2.3 (R403.2.3). Building framing cavities shall not be used as ducts or plenums. 
Exception: Building framing cavities used as ducts or plenums shall comply with Section 
M1601.1.1.  

 
(R) Table N1102.2.21 (Table R402.1.1) shall be amended to read as follows: 
 

 
 
SECTION 5. Title 7, Chapter 7, of the City Code of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, is hereby 
amended as follows: 
 
7-7-1: INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE ADOPTED: 
 
(A) International Mechanical Code Adopted: The International Mechanical Code, 20152 Edition, 
published by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as an official Code of the 
City, except the portions deleted, modified or amended by the provisions of this Chapter.  
 
(B) Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Mechanical Code, 20152 Edition, shall be 
retained by the City Clerk for use and examination by the public.  
 
7-7-2: AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE:  
 
(A) Section 103.2 , Appointmentof the International Mechanical Code, 2012 Edition, shall be 
amended to read as follows:  
 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 11 OF 14 
 

103.2 Appointment. The Code Official shall be appointed by the chief appointing 
authority of the jurisdiction.  

 
(B) Section 109.1 of the International Mechanical Code, 2012 EditionApplication for Appeal, 
shall be amended to read as follows: 
 

109.1 Application for appeal. A person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the 
code official to the board of appeals. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim 
that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been 
incorrectly interpreted. The application shall be filed on a form obtained from the code 
official within twenty (20) days after the notice was served. 

 
SECTION 6. Title 7, Chapter 11, of the City Code of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, is hereby 
amended as follows: 
 
7-11-1: INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE ADOPTED:  
 
(A) International Energy Conservation Code Adopted: The International Energy Conservation 
Code, 20125 Edition, published by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as an 
official Code of the City, except the portions deleted, modified or amended by the provisions of 
this Chapter.  
 
(B) Code on File: One (1) copy of the International Energy Conservation Code, 20125 Edition, 
duly certified by the Clerk, shall be retained by the City Clerk for use and examination by the 
public.  
 
7-11-2: AMENDMENTS TO INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE:  
 
(A) (A) Table R402.1.12 (Table N1102.2.1) shall be amended to read as follows: 
 

Table 402.1.2 

Insulation and fenestration Requirements By Component 

 

(B) (B) Section R402.2 shall be deleted. 
 
(CB) The following section shall be added to the International Energy Conservation Code, 2012 
Edition(N1102.4.1.2):  



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 12 OF 14 
 

 
CR402.4.1.23 Visual inspection option. Building envelope tightness and insulation 
installation shall be considered acceptable when the items listed in Table 402.4.1.1, 
applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. Where required by code official 
an approved party independent from the installer of the insulation shall inspect the air 
barrier and insulation.  
 
 

(DC) The following section shall be added to the International Energy Conservation Code, 2012 
Edition:  
 

R403.2.33.5 Building Cavities. Building framing cavities shall not be used as ducts or 
plenums.  

 
Exception: Building framing cavities used as ducts or plenums shall comply with Section 
M1601.1.1 (20152 International Residential Code).  

 
(EA) Section C405.5.1.1 shall be amended added to read as follows:  
 

C405.5.1.12.1A Screw lamp holders. The wattage shall be the maximum labeled wattage 
of the luminaire.  
 
Exception: Compact Fluorescent lamps shall use the rated wattage of the lamp and ballast.  

 
SECTION 7. Title 7-13-1 of the City Code of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, is hereby amended 
as follows: 
 
7-13-1: INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE:  
 
(A) International Existing Building Code Adopted. The International Existing Building Code 
(20152 Edition), published by the International Code Council, Inc. is hereby adopted as an 
official code of the City.  
 
(B) Code on file: One (1) copy of the International Existing Building Code (20152 Edition) duly 
certified by the Clerk, shall be retained by the City Clerk for use and examination by the public. 
 
SECTION 8.  Savings and Severability Clause.  The provisions and parts of this Ordinance are 
intended to be severable.  If any section, sentence, clause, or phrase of this Ordinance should be 
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or 
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, sentence, 
clause, or phrase of this Ordinance.   
 
SECTION 9.  Codification Clause. The City Clerk is instructed to immediately forward this 
Ordinance to the codifier of the official municipal code for proper revision of the Code. 
 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 13 OF 14 
 

SECTION 10.  Publication.  This Ordinance, or a summary thereof in compliance with Idaho 
Code, shall be published once in the official newspaper of the City, and shall take effect 
immediately upon its passage, approval, and publication. 
 
SECTION 11.  Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its 
passage, approval, and publication. 
 
PASSED by the City Council and APPROVED by the Mayor of the City of Idaho Falls, Idaho, 
this _____ day of December, 2017. 

       CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO 

 
       ____________________________________ 
       REBECCA L. NOAH CASPER, MAYOR 
ATTEST: 

 
 
_____________________________________ 
KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK 
 
 
(SEAL) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
STATE OF IDAHO  )  
    )  ss: 
County of Bonneville  ) 
 
I, KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO,  
DO HEREBY CERTIFY: 
 

That the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of the Ordinance 
entitled, “AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, 
AMENDING TITLE 7 ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2015 EDITIONS OF 
THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 
MAINTENANCE CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 



 
 

ORDINANCE –BUILDING CODES  PAGE 14 OF 14 
 

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION 
CODE; ADOPTING THE 2015 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
EXISTING BUILDING CODE; PROVIDING SEVERABILITY, 
CODIFICATION, PUBLICATION BY SUMMARY, AND ESTABLISHING 
EFFECTIVE DATE.” 
 
 

 
      _______________________________________ 
 (SEAL)    KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK 



PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

lDAHO FALLS

Chrk H Froderlcksan, P.E I R bllc Worls Dlrcctot
office (2oa) 612-8256

Fax (2o8) 612-857O

WORKS M EMORANDUM
TO Honorable Mayor & City Council

FRoM: Chris H Fredericksen, Public Works Director

DATE: Decemb er 15,2017

RE: Speed Limit Resolution - Rollandet Avenue from 21st Street to Sunnyside Road

Please find attached for your consideration a Resolution to establish a Speed Limit of 35 miles per

hour (mph) on Rollandet Avenue from 2lst Street to Sunnyside Road.

The speed limit on this portion of Rollandet Avenue historically changes between 25 mph in the

summir and 35 mph for the remainder of the year. The Traffic Safety Committee considered and

recommended esdblishing a consistent year around speed limit of 35 mph at its June l3n,20l7
meeting.

Observed 85th percentile traffic speeds for various routes are depicted in an attachment to this

memo.

Public Works recommends approval of this Resolution; and, authorization for the Mayor and City
Clerk to sign the document.

Attachments

20t't -129

P.o. Box 5O22O | 38O Constitution Way I ldaho Fallt ldaho 834O5-O22O

PUBLIC



Observed 85th Percentile Traffic Speeds

Recomrnendstions
Rollendrt- 35 mph ytrr'round
Bpulevard- 3tI rnph
Holrfits Avr - 40 mPh

lohn Adams Pkwv - 30 mPh

I
I lt-t

.l
+ i; I I4tr I

t a 30 il 35il It a

t- 30
3T,29 ?E I ffi

atil -l
''*r
\ J

fl I 31 Io I
rtrtf ;

: rt
d-tr. t { tl-l '.*'t I IT *

aI aa aII

I' trI a

II
fi2

,' :r
134

B
i;t

33 3r t I
t,

a
I I

t_r"
., I

a
I

,
I il

E

t

1341 gg
1e{35} 41 39

I
.t .b"# tl

l^
'l

F
rf

F/

J

.l,-.'rF

fi
L,,/

E



RESOLUTION NO. 2OI7-

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A MUNICIPAL

CORPORATIONOFTHESTATEOFIDAHO,SETTINGTHEPOSTEDSPEED
LIMIT OF 35 MPH ON ROLLANDET AVENUE FROM WEST 21ST STREET

TO WEST SUNNYSIDE ROAD AND PROVIDTNG THAT THIS RESOLUTION

BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND INSTALLATION OF

APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE.

WHEREAS, the speed limit on Rollandet Avenue from West 2l't Street to West Sunnyside Road

is currently set and posted at 35 MPH during the winter months and 25 MPH during the summer

months; and

WHEREAS, Idaho Code g 4g-ZO8 and Idaho Falls City Code 9-3-3 authorize the City Council to

establish and alter speed limits on the public rights-of-way within the geographic limits of the City

of Idaho Falls; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined, on the basis of an engineering and traffic study, that

it is reasonably safe under the conditions found to exist on the rights-of-way listed above to

increase the speed limits on these right-of-ways'

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, AS FOLLOWS:

l. That the speed limit on Rollandet Avenue from West 2l't Street to West Sunnyside Road

shall be set and posted at 35 MPH, with no seasonal variations; and

2. That the City Council hereby determines that the establishment of these speed limits are

reasonably safe and will facilitate the orderly movement of vehicular traffic.

3. That this resolution take effect immediately

ADOPTED and effective this 

- 

day of December,Z0l7

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION . ROLLANDET

Rebecca L. Noah Casper, Mayor

PAGE 1 OF 2



ATTEST:

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk

(sEAL)

STATE OF IDAHO )

) ss:

)County of Bonneville

I, KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, DO

HEREBY CERTIFY:

That the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of the Resolution

entitled, ..A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A
MUNICIPAL CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, SETTING THE

POSTED SPEED LIMIT OF 35 MPH ON ROLLANDET AVENUE FROM

wEST 21ST STREET TO WEST SUNNYSIDE ROAD AND PROVIDING THAT
THIS RESOLUTION BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND
TNSTALLATION OF APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE."

(SEAL)

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION - ROI-LANDET

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk

PAGE 2 OF 2



PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

IDAHO FALLS

Chris H Frederlcksen, P.E' I Prtbllc Wo*s Dlrcctor
Office (2O8) 612-8256

Fax (2O8) 62'A570

?

WORKS MEMORANDUM
To: Honorable MaYor & CitY Council

FROM: Chris H Fredericksen, Public Works Director

DATE: December 15,2017

RE: Speed Limit Resolution - South Boulevard from Northgate Mile to Sunnyside Road

please find attached for your consideration a Resolution to establish a Speed

hour (mph) on South Boulevard from Northgate Mile to sunnyside Road.

public Works intends to complete a number of construction projects within these limits of South

Boulevard in 2018 and has determined that a speed limit of 30 mph would be reasonable and

prudent. Currently, South Boulevard has a posted speed timit of 25 mph between Northgate Mile

and 17th Street and 35 mph between 17th Street and Sunnyside Road.

If approved, the proposed speed limit will be re-evaluated after implementation to determine if any

changes need to be considered.

Observed 85th percentile traffic speeds for various routes are depicted in an attachment to this

memo.

Public Works recommends approval of this Resolution; and, authorization for the Mayor and City

Clerk to sign the document.

Attachments

2017-127

Limit of 30 miles per

P.O. Box 5O22O | 38O Constitution Way I ldaho Falls, ldaho 834O5-O22O



Observed 85th Percentile Traffic Speeds

Recommendations
Rollendet- 35 mPh Ytrr'round
Bpulevarrd- 30 rnph
Holrnts Avt - 40 ttph
John Adarrns Pkwy - 30 rnPh

I *-r
.,
a] I i

I!;
If t

I ,'{J ;

L,."i,. i,,r

I 30 r 35

il
? a

I ffi
31rk ls 2E t xfi

- JI
l J

E! rJ I 31 30 I
rf,lr

: fr
E it il {

; ifrI I II r l-l *
1

I t T
t

q
I FTI 34

ffi
r

33 3? I I a

ffi
I *

a]-r

E

E
.r

ffi I

I IIE

134Ila 3e{3s) 4t 39
In'r
lr

'l
FI

a*.b"*
{

EI

FI-IE il1y14

I



RESOLUTION NO. 2OI7-

A RESOLUTTON OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A MUNICIPAL

CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, SETTING THE POSTED SPEED

LIMIT OF 30 MPH ON SOUTH BOULEVARD FROM NORTHGATE MILE TO

SUNNYSIDE ROAD AND PROVTDTNG THAT THIS RESOLUTION BE

EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND INSTALLATION OF APPROPRIATE

SIGNAGE.

WHEREAS, the speed limit on South Boulevard from Northgate Mile to East Sunnyside Road is

currently set and posted at 25 MPH between Northgate Mile and 17ft Street and 35 MPH between

lTth Street and Sunnyside Road; and

WHEREAS, Idaho Code g 4g-2OB and Idaho Falls City Code 9-3-3 authorize the City Council to

establish and alter speed limits on the public rights-of-way within the geographic limits of the City

of Idaho Falls;and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined, on the basis of an engineering and traffic study, that

it is reasonably safe under the conditions found to exist on the rights-of-way listed above to

increase the speed limits on these right-of-ways.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COLINCIL OF THE

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, AS FOLLOWS:

l. That the speed limit on South Boulevard from Northgate Mile to Sunnyside Road shall be

set and posted at 30 MPH; and

2. That the City Council hereby determines that the establishment of these speed limits are

reasonably safe and will facilitate the orderly movement of vehicular traffic.

3. That this resolution take effect immediately

ADOPTED and effective this 

- 

day of December,20l7

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION _ BOULEVARD

Rebecca L. Noah Casper, Mayor

PAGE I OF 2



ATTEST:

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk

(SEAL)

STATE OF IDAHO

Countv of Bonneville

I, KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, DO

HEREBY CERTIFY:

That the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of the Resolution

entitled, ..A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A
MUNICIPAL CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, SETTTNG THE

POSTED SPEED LIMIT OF 30 MPH ON SOUTH BOULEVARD FROM

NORTHGATE MILE TO SUNNYSIDE ROAD AND PROVIDTNG THAT THIS

RESOLUTION BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND INSTALLATION
OF APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE.''

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk

(sEAL)

)

) ss:

)

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION _ BOULEVARD PAGE 2 OF 2



PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT Chrls H Frederlcksan, P.E. I R bllc Worl$ Dlrector
Office (2O8) 612-8256

Fax (2oa) 612-4570

M EMORANDUM

please find attached for your consideration a Resolution to establish a Speed Limit of40 miles per

hour (mph) on South Holmes Avenue from East 17th Street to East Sunnyside Road'

The speed limit on this portion of South Holmes Avenue is currently 35 mph. The Traffic Safety

Committee considered this speed increase on December l2th,2017 and recommended increasing

the posted speed limit to 40 mph.

Observed 85th percentile traffic speeds for various routes are depicted in an attachment to this

memo.

To: Honorable Mayor & CitY Council

FROM: Chds H Fredericksen, Public Works Director

DATE: December 15,2017

RE: Speed Limit Resolution - South Holmes Avenue from East 17th Street to East Sunnyside

Road

Public Works recommends approval of this Resolution; and, authorization for the Mayor and City

Clerk to sign the document.

Attachments

2017-128

P.O. Box 5O22O | 38O Constitution Way I ldaho Falls, ldaho 834O5-O22O

!DAHO FALLS
PUBLIC
WORKS



Observed 85th Percentile Traffic Speeds

Recommendations
Rollendtt- 35 mPh ytrr'round
Eoulevand - 3O rnPh

Holmrs Arrc - 40 mph
Iohn Adams Pktrry - 30 rnPh

t

ia

.i\
,l

ftI]
I

I

t
I
t

h

I
I



RESOLUTION NO. 2OI7-

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A MUNICIPAL

CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, SETTING THE POSTED SPEED

LIMIT OF 40 MPH ON SOUTH HOLMES AVENUE FROM 17TH STREET TO

EAST SUNNYSIDE ROAD, AND PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION BE

EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND TNSTALLATION OF APPROPRIATE

SIGNAGE.

WHEREAS, the speed limit on South Holmes Avenue from East 17th Street to Sunnyside Road is

currently set and posted at 35 MPH; and

WHEREAS, Idaho Code g 49-208 and Idaho Falls City Code 9-3-3 authorize the City Council to

establish and alter speed limits on the public rights-of-way within the geographic limits of the City

of Idaho Falls;and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined, on the basis of an engineering and traffic study, that

it is reasonably safe under the conditions found to exist on the rights-of-way listed above to

increase the speed limits on these right-of-ways.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, AS FOLLOWS:

l. That the speed limit South Holmes Avenue from East l Tth Street to Sunnyside Road shall

be set and posted at 40 MPH; and

2. That the City Council hereby determines that the establishment of these speed limits are

reasonably safe and will facilitate the orderly movement of vehicular traffic.

3. That this resolution take effect immediately.

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION -HOLMES

Rebecca L. Noah Casper, Mayor

PAGE I OF 2

ADOPTED and effective this 

- 

day of December, 2017.



ATTEST:

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk

(SEAL)

STATE OF IDAHO )

) ss:

)County of Bonneville

I, KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, DO

HEREBY CERTIFY:

That the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of the Resolution

entitled, "A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A
MUNICIPAL CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, SETTTNG THE

POSTED SPEED LIMIT OF 40 MPH ON SOUTH HOLMES AVENUE FROM

17TH STREET TO EAST STJNNYSIDE ROAD, AND PROVIDTNG THAT THIS

RESOLUTION BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND INSTALLATION
OF APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE."

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk

(SEAL)

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION _HOLMES PAGE 2 OF 2



PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

IDAHO FALLS

Chrls H Frederlcksen, P.E. I t.tbllc Works Dlrcctor
Office (2O8) 612-A256

Fax (2o8) 612-8570

MEMORANDUMWORKS
To: Honorable MaYor & CitY Council

FRoM: Chris H Fredericksen, Public Works Director

DATE: December 15,2017

RE: Speed Limit Resolution - John Adams Parkway from 25th East (Hitt Road) to South

Holmes Avenue

Please find attached for your consideration a Resolution to establish

hour (mph) on John Adams Parkway from 25th East (Hitt Road) to S

The speed limit on this portion of John Adams Parkway is currently 25 mph. The Traffic Safety

Committee considered this speed increase on December l}th, 2017 and recommended against

increasing the posted speed limit to 30 mph. The committee vote was tied and the duty of the final

decision ihen defaulted to the chairperson. The chairperson voted against increasing the posted

speed limit.

Observed 85ft percentile traffic speeds for various routes are depicted in an attachment to this

memo.

a Speed Limit of 30 miles per

outh Holmes Avenue.

public Works has evaluated the recommendation from the Traffic Safety Committee, yet

recommends approval of this Resolution; and, authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign

the document.

Attachments

2017-130

P.O. Box 5O22O | 38O Constitution Way I ldaho Falls, ldaho 834O5-O22O

BL a,



o E
T

10 o - o C
L s (ll t+ ! o - (,l o = f. -o { - o, {r =
t

ct ln E
' o o C
L

t0

E
 T

 8
 T

E

+
[iF

lH
r 
i *

 ll
r

i 
r 

ig
la

*E
 " 

E
J- 1l B

6
I

E = CL

.t J g

I

{t
:

I
i. :, F

"

n
' 

t,' -t
tn

I'1
r

n
I



RESOLUTION NO. 2OI7-

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A MUNICIPAL

CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, SETTING THE POSTED SPEED

LIMIToF30MPHoNJoHNADAMSPARKWAYFROMSOUTHZ'THEAST
(HITTROAD)ToSOUTHH0LMESAVENUEANDPROVIDINGTHATTHIS
RESOLUTION BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS PASSAGE AND INSTALLATION

OF APPROPzuATE SIGNAGE.

WHEREAS, the speed limit on John Adams Parkway from South 25th East (Hitt Road) to South

Holmes Avenue is currently set and posted at 25 MPH and

WHEREAS, Idaho code g 4g-2og and Idaho Falls city code 9-3-3 authorize the city council to

establish and alter speed limits on the public rights-of-way within the geographic limits of the City

of Idaho Falls; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined, on the basis of an engineering and traffic study, that

it is reasonably safe under the conditions found to exist on the rights-of-way listed above to

increase the speed limits on these right-of-ways.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, AS FOLLOWS:

1. That the speed limit on John Adams Parkway from South 25th East (Hitt Road) to South

Holmes Avenue shall be set and posted at 30 MPH; and

2. That the City Council hereby determines that the establishment of these speed limits are

reasonably safe and will facilitate the orderly movement of vehicular traffic'

3. That this resolution take effect immediately.

ADOPTED and effective this 

- 

day of December,20l7

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS,IDAHO

Rebecca L. Noah Casper, Mayor

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION _ JOHN ADAMS PARKWAY PAGE I OF 2



ATTEST:

Kathy Hampton, CitY Clerk

(sEAL)

STATE OF IDAHO )

) ss:

)Countv of Bonneville

I, KATHY HAMPTON, CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, DO

HEREBY CERTIFY:

That the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of the Resolution

entitled, ..A RESOLUTION OF THE CTTY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO, A

MUNICIPAL CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, SETTTNG THE

POSTED SPEED LIMIT OF 30 MPH ON JOHN ADAMS PARKWAY FROM

SOUTH 25TH EAST (HITT ROAD) TO SOUTH HOLMES AVENUE AND

PROVIDING THAT THIS RESOLUTION BE EFFECTIVE UPON ITS

PASSAGE AND INSTALLATION OF APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE."

Kathy Hampton, City Clerk

(SEAL)

SPEED LIMIT ALTERATION _ JOHN ADAMS PARKWAY PAGE 2 OF 2


	12-21-2017 Special Council Meeting Agenda
	Consent Agenda
	4.A.1) MS - Bid IF-18-I, Bucket Truck
	4.A.2) MS - Bid IF-18-H, Pickup with Tommy Gate
	4.A.3) MS - Bid IF-18-H, Replacement Vehicles
	4.B.1) Clerk - Canvass of the Vote
	Regular Agenda
	5.A.1) HR - Police Bargaining Unit
	5.B.1) MS - Committee Name Change
	5.C.1) IFFD - Physio Control Service Plan
	5.C.2) IFFD - New Firefighter and Peace Officer Resolution
	5.D.1) IFP - PacifiCorp MOU
	5.E.1) CDS - I-Codes Adoption
	5.F.1) PW - Rollandet, 21st St to Sunnyside
	5.F.2) PW - S Blvd, Northgate Mile to Sunnyside
	5.F.3) PW - S Holmes, 17th St to Sunnyside
	5.F.4) PW - John Adams Pkwy



