IDAHO FALLS CITY COUNCIL MEETING

Thursday, October 26, 2017
7:30 p.m.
CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS
680 Park Avenue
Idaho Falls, ID 83402

Thank you for your interest in City Government. If you wish to express your thoughts on a matter listed below, please
contact Councilmembers by email or personally before the meeting. Public testimony on agenda items will not be taken
unless a hearing is indicated. Be aware that an amendment to this agenda may be made upon passage of a motion that
states the reason for the amendment and the good faith reason that the agenda item was not included in the original
agenda posting. Regularly-scheduled City Council Meetings are live streamed at www.idahofallsidaho.gov, then archived
on the city website. If you need communication aids or services or other physical accommodations to participate or access
this meeting, please contact City Clerk Kathy Hampton at 612-8414 or the ADA Coordinator Lisa Farris at 612-8323 as soon
as possible and they will accommodate your needs.

1. Call to Order.
2. Pledge of Allegiance.
3. Public Comment. Members of the public are invited to address the City Council regarding matters

that are not on this agenda or already noticed for a public hearing. When you address the Council, please state
your name and address for the record and please limit your remarks to three (3) minutes. Please note that
matters currently pending before the Planning Commission or Board of Adjustment which may be the subject of
a pending enforcement action, or which are relative to a City personnel matter are not suitable for public
comment.

4, Consent Agenda. Any item may be removed from the Consent Agenda at the request of any member
of the Council for separate consideration.

A. Office of the Mayor:
1) Economic Development-Community Development Grant Awards
2) Official Proclamations from the preceding month
B. Item from Public Works:
1) Bid Award — 65™ South Pump Station to Well 18 Water Line
C. Items from Municipal Services:
1) Bid IF-17-22, Parks Wayfinding
2) BidIF-17-23, Line Clearance Project
3) Bid IF-18-D, Airport Security System
D. Items from Idaho Falls Public Library:
1) Library Resolution

E. Items from the City Clerk:


http://www.idahofallsidaho.gov/

1) Expenditure Summary for the month of September, 2017.

2) Minutes from the September 28, 2017 Idaho Falls Power Board Meeting; October 2, 2017
Special Meeting; October 10, 2017 Council Work Session; October 12, 2017 Idaho Falls Power
Board Meeting; and October 12, 2017 Council Meeting.

3) License Applications, all carrying the required approvals.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve, accept, or receive all items on the Consent Agenda
according to the recommendations presented (or take other action deemed appropriate).

5. Regular Agenda.
A. Community Development Services

1) RSC-1 Site Plan Approval and Reasoned Statement of Relevant Criteria and Standards for
Dutch Bros. Coffee, Lot 1, Block 1, Candy Cottage Addition: For consideration is the application
for RSC-1 Site Plan Approval and Reasoned Statement of Relevant Criteria and Standards for Dutch
Bros. Coffee, Lot 1, Block 1, Candy Cottage Addition. The Planning and Zoning Commission
considered this application at its October 3, 2017 meeting and recommended approval by
unanimous vote with conditions that the site plan show a 50 foot setback, a pedestrian connection
be added from the sidewalk to the building, and that north access to Bonita be labeled as one-way
traffic. The required adjustments have been made. Staff recommends approval of the application.

RECOMMENDED ACTIONS: (in sequential order)
a. To approve the Site Plan for Dutch Bros. Coffee, Lot 1, Block 1, Candy Cottage Addition.

b. To approve the Reasoned Statement of Relevant Criteria and Standards for the Site Plan for
Dutch Bros. Coffee, Lot 1, Block 1, Candy Cottage Addition, and give authorization for the
Mayor to execute the necessary documents.

B. Parks and Recreation

1) South Fork Archers Lease Agreement: For consideration is a Lease Agreement renewal
between the City of Idaho Falls and South Fork Archers for the purposes of leasing property for
archery range usage from October 1, 2017 through September 30, 2022.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the South Fork Archers lease agreement renewal, and give
authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents (or take other
action deemed appropriate).

2) Woodbury Special Warranty Deed and Memorandum of Understanding: For consideration is
a Memorandum of Understanding and Special Warranty Deed to accept the donation of a parcel of
property as well as to agree to design, develop and construct a public restroom on said property in
aesthetic similarity to the adjacent Hotel.
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RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the Memorandum of Understanding and Special Warranty
Deed, and give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents (or
take other action deemed appropriate).

Public Works

1) Easement Vacation Request — Portion of Dedicated Easement located Southeast of
Broadway/Old Butte Road Intersection: Liberty Homes is requesting the vacation of a portion of a
dedicated public utility easement, Instrument No. 1309254. They have built upon a portion of the
easement and have agreed to provide additional easement as requested by review utilities.
Utilities have no objection to the request as long as the additional easement is provided.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To give authorization for City Attorney to prepare documents needed
to accomplish the vacation (or take other action deemed appropriate).

2) Minor Change Order No. 1 — 7th Street Water Line Replacement from South Boulevard to
Holmes Avenue: For consideration is Change Order No. 1 to the 7th Street Water Line
Replacement from South Boulevard to Holmes Avenue project. During construction the existing
base material beneath the existing pavement was deemed inadequate and needed to be replaced.
In addition, unsuitable building material was encountered throughout the project that required
removal and replacement of these materials as well. The total cost to the City for this additional
work is $207,476.50 which will be apportioned between the Street and Water Divisions.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the Change Order No. 1 to the 7th Street Water Line
Replacement from South Boulevard to Holmes Avenue project, and give authorization for the
Mayor to execute the necessary documents (or take other action deemed appropriate).

Idaho Falls Power

1) Acceptance of Qualified Bidders for 15th Street Substation Rebuild and Invitation to Bid: At
the August 24 City Council meeting, Council authorized staff to prequalify potential bidders for
general contractor work associated with upgrades to the 15th Street Substation. Ten potential
bidders responded to our advertised solicitation. The responses have been reviewed by our
engineer, MPE Consulting, with five being deemed qualified and allowed to move forward.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve prequalification of Cache Valley Electric, Caribou
Construction, Anderson & Wood Construction, Probst Electric, and Wheeler Electric and authorize
the bid package to be mailed to these contractors for competitive bidding (or take other action
deemed appropriate).

2) Approve Battelle Energy Alliance (BEA) LLC Utility Update Agreement: This agreement is for
the conversion of their facilities to a negotiated rate due to the triggering of the new large single
load rate with the construction of the C3 and Cybercore buildings. This agreement outlines the
work required to convert their facilities to the new rate along with interconnection of the two new
buildings, C3 and Cybercore.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the agreement with Battelle Energy Alliance (BEA) LLC, and
give authorization for the Mayor to execute the necessary documents (or take other action
deemed appropriate).
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3) Approve License Agreement for Access with Verizon Wireless: Idaho 6 - Clark Limited
Partnership dba Verizon Wireless has requested permission to use property owned and
maintained by Idaho Falls Power as access to adjacent property they lease. Their leasehold
property includes a cellular tower, for which placement was approved by Bonneville County.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To approve the Lease Agreement for Access with Idaho 6 — Clark
Limited Partnership dba Verizon Wireless, and give authorization for the Mayor to execute the
necessary documents (or take other action deemed appropriate).

Legal

1) Public Hearing: Proposed fee increase to Ambulance fees and charges: This proposed fee
increase and notification of hearing was advertised October 15 and October 22 as required by
Idaho Code.

2) Resolution to Adopt Fees: This Resolution will amend and update ambulance fees and
charges. The proposed changes are necessary to address the increased cost of providing
ambulance service.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: To adopt the resolution to add and update the noticed fees into the
City’s fee schedule.

Motion to Adjourn.
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IDAHO

OFFICE OF THE MAYOR Office (208) 612-8235
Fax (208) 612-8560

FALLS

MEMORANDUM
TO: City Council RE: Community Support Grant ad-hoc
FROM: Office of the Mayor Committee Report

DATE: )6 October, 2017

Attached please find the summary report from the Community Support Grant ad hoc citizen
committee. The report provides a detailed breakdown of the total amount of grant funding
recommended for each nonprofit organization that applied for public funding during the 2017-2018
fiscal year.

The committee considered the merits of each request along with available funds and relative need
for each organization. The committee also examined the nexus between each request and the
essential city purpose it will achieve. The Council discussed each request in detail in the 23 October

Work Session and did not recommended any substantive changes to the awards as presented.
Once approved, award letters will be sent to each applicant. The awards will be distributed upon

request. A six-month preliminary report on the use of the funds will be requested from each
recipient in March, 2018.

P.O. Box 50220 | 308 Constitution Way | Idaho Falls, Idaho 83405-0220



OFFICE OF THE MAYOR Office (208) 612-8235
Fax (208) 612-8560

Community Support Grant
Fiscal Year 2017-2018 Funding Recommendations

Amount Amount

FY2017/18 Applicants Requested Recommended
Community Food Basket S 35,000.00 | $ 12,000.00
Idaho Falls Community Garden Association S 8,200.00 | $ 1,500.00
Behavioral Health Crisis Center S 7,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
Idaho Falls Historic Downtown Foundation S 10,000.00 | S S
The Eagle Rock Art Guild S 2,350.00 | S 1,000.00
Greater Idaho Falls Chamber of Commerce S 15,000.00 | S 10,000.00
Grand Teton Council S 7,520.26 | § 1,300.00
The Haven Shelter (EICAP) S 10,500.00 | S .
Idaho Falls Area Humanitarian Center S 8,500.00 | $ 8,500.00
The Center for HOPE S 1,050.00 | S 1,050.00
Idaho Falls Symphony Society, Inc. S 10,000.00 | S 3,000.00
Idaho Falls Arts Council S 50,000.00 | $ 23,000.00
Idaho Falls Downtown Development Corporation | $ 3,900.00 | $ 3,900.00
Museum of Idaho S 50,000.00 | $ 23,000.00
National Federation of the Blind S 20,100.00 | $ 3,500.00
Senior Citizens' Community Center S 12,000.00 | S 12,000.00
The Shepherd's Inn S 8,498.00 | § 4,250.00
Snake River Animal Shelter S 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00
The Art Museum of Eastern Idaho S 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
Total S 275,618.26 | S 130,000.00

P.O. Box 50220 | 308 Constitution Way | Idaho Falls, Idaho 83405-0220



OFFICE OF THE MAYOR Rebecca L. Noah Casper | Mayor
Office (208) 612-8235
Fax (208) 612-8560

IDAHO FALLS

MEMORANDUM

TO: City Council

FROM: Rebecca Casper
DATE: October 26, 2017
RE: Proclamations for October 2017

Please find attached copies of official proclamations prepared and released by the Mayor’s Office
throughout the month of October.

e Small Business Saturday: The Saturday after Thanksgiving, November 25, 2017
Submitted via email on October 6™ to Pam Woo, Senior Director, Finance and Operations,
Women Impacting Public Policy

e Disability Employment Awareness Month: October 1% through October 31°
Joint proclamation from Mayor Casper and Mayor Kirkham. Given to Beth Eloe-Reep on
behalf of the Idaho Falls Community Transition Team to be read by Council President
Tom Hally at their Disability Mentoring Day on Thursday October 19,

e Careers in Construction Month: October 1% through October 31%

PDF delivered via email on October 17" to Nadene Michaelson on behalf of Eastern Idaho
Home Builders Association.

P.O. Box 50220 | 308 Constitution Way | Idaho Falls, Idaho 83405-0220



WHEREAS,

WHEREAS,

WHEREAS,

WHEREAS,

WHEREAS,

WHEREAS,

WHEREAS,

WHEREAS,

PROCLAMATION
T — o<l ——

the city of Idaho Falls celebrates our local small business and the contributions they make to our local economy and

community; and

according to the United States Small Business Administration, there are currently 28.8 million small businesses in
the United States representing 99.7% of all businesses with employees in the United States and 63% net new jobs
created over the past 20 years; and

small businesses employ 48% of the employees in the private sector in the United States; and

on average, 33% of consumers’ holiday shopping will be done at small, independently-owned retailers and

restaurants; and

91% of all consumers believe that supporting small, independently-owned restaurants and bars is important;

and
76% of all consumers plan to go to one or more small businesses as part of their holiday shopping; and

Idaho Falls supports our local businesses as they create jobs, boos our local economy and preserve our

neighborhoods; and

advocacy groups as well as public and private organizations across the country have endorsed the Saturday

after Thanksgiving as Small Business Saturday.

THEREFORE, I, REBECCA CASPER, MAYOR of Idaho Falls, Idaho do hereby proclaim,

Small Business Saturday

and urge the residents of our community, fo join with other communities across the country, in support of small businesses and

merchants on Small Business Saturday and throughout the year.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and caused the
seal of the City of Idaho Falls to be affixed on this 6™ day of October,

two-thousand Seventeen

Rebecca L. Noah Casper, Mayor
City of Idaho Falls
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since passage of the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) in 1990 and the Amendments
Act in 2008, more than one million men and women with disabilities have entered the s

labor force and bccomet_axayers, consumers, and workers who contribute to our society §
and fo their own fulfillment of the American dream; and

this notable progress notwithstanding, barriers to full participation still remain for large
numbers of individuals with disabilities who are seeking employment; and

new generations of young people with disabilities are growing up in Eastern Idaho —
graduating from high school, going to college, and otherwise preparing to participate fully |
in the workplace, who have a right to maximize their potential by making the most of their
intellect, talents, and abilities; and

WHEREAS, as a community, we must reaffirm our determination to achieve full inclusion by working
to break down barriers for local residents because, doing so represents a lasting investment
in the future of Eastern Idaho.

WHEREAS, each year our great nation observes National Disability Employment Awareness month
during October, making it a great time to recognize the contributions of individuals with
disabilities in the workforce, to work together to break down employment barriers, and to

work toward full inclusion for persons with disabilities; and

WHEREAS, Disability Mentoring Day, to be observed this year on October 25", 2017, is a public
private partnership sponsored by the Idaho Falls Community Transition Team and the
College of Eastern Idaho Foundation; and

WHEREAS, this year’s Disability Mentoring Day events will provide an opportunity for jobseekers with
disabilities to gain insight into career options by spending part of the day in the workplace
“shadowing” an employee in the course of a normal day on the job.

THEREFORE, WE REBECCA CASPER, MAYOR, City of Idaho Falls, and DANA KIRKHAM, MAYOR, City of Ammon, | !
hereby proclaim October 1, 2017 through October 31, 2017 as

Disability Employment Awareness Month

to recognize the enormous potential of individuals with disabilities and to encourage everyone to work
ith disabilities into the workforce. The City of Idaho Falls and the

toward full integration of individuals

i,’ Mayor Dana Kirkham, Mayor
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PROCLAMATION

the Eastern Idaho Home Builders Association (EIHBA) and the Idaho Falls Technical High School
Student Chapter celebrate Careers in Construction Month in October and builders around the
country seek skilled craftsmen to help them build the American dream; and

after many workers left the home building industry during the Great Recession to pursue
employment in other sectors, not nearly enough of them have returned thereby creating a labor
shortage that has led to construction delays and increased consumer costs; and

the EITHBA mentorship program for Technical High School students offers opportunities for job
shadowing, performance evaluation, paid summer internships, and other opportunities for teens to
gain experience working in the home construction industry; and

NAHB’s educational partner, HBI, is an building industry career training leader, offering educational|
programs in 41 states and the District of Columbia, reaching more than 13,000 students each year—
including more than 5,000 additional students in HBI’s pre-apprenficeship programs; and

With 140 secondary, associate and four-year college chapters throughout the country, NAHB’s
Student Chapters Program is another important component in preparing the next generation of
building professionals by offering students first-hand exposure to the building industry through
NAHB membership, educational programming and networking opportunities.

THEREFORE, I, REBECCA CASPER, MAYOR of the City of Idaho Falls, do hereby proclaim the month of October as

Careers in Construction Month

and encourage educators, parents and students to take a look at the career opportunities available in residential
construction and understand that a vocational education offers a satisfying career path and financial gain. (Visit

nahb.org or hbi.org to learn more.)

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand
and caused the seal of the City of Idaho Falls to be
affixed on this 17™ day of October, gwo thousand and

7 \.._//
#ecca L.\Noalk'C. 1, Mayor
City of Idahp Fal
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PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT Chris H Fredericksen, P.E. | Public Works Director
Office (208) 612-8256
Fax (208) 612-8570

IDAHO FALLS

WORKS MEMORANDUM

TO: Honorable Mayor & City Council

FROM: Chris H Fredericksen, Public Works Director
DATE: October 19, 2017

RE: Bid Award — 65th South, Pump Station to Well 18 Water Line

On Wednesday, October 18, 2017, bids were received and opened for the 65th South, Pump Station
to Well 18 Water Line. A tabulation of bid results is attached.

Public Works recommends approval of the plans and specifications, award to the lowest responsive,
responsible bidder, HK Contractors Inc., in an amount of $238,949.00 and, authorization for the
Mayor and City Clerk to sign contract documents.

1-37-01-4-WTR-2016-32
2017-100

P.O. Box 50220 | 380 Constitution Way | Idaho Falls, Idaho 83405-0220



Submitted

City of Idaho Falls

Engineering Department

65th South Pump Station to Well 18 Site Water Line

Kent J. Fugal, P.E., PTOE

Bid Tabulation

Number...... 1-37-01-4-WTR-2016-32

October 18, 2017

Engineer's Estimate HK Contractors, Inc. Knife R:\\Il:rrﬂ(:v(\)lreztt)ration ) 3H Construction, LLC TMC Contractors, Inc. Eagle Rock Timber, Inc. Mesquite, Inc.
Estimated
Item Number Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Amoun Unit Price Total Amoun Unit Price Total Amoun Unit Price Total Amoun Unit Price Total Amoun Unit Price Total Amoun Unit Price Total Amoun
EARTHWORK AND BASES
209.09.2 Aggregate Base 4CY. $30.00 $120.00]  $135.00 $540.00 $75.00 $300.00 $50.00 $200.00 $57.50 $230.00 $56.25 $225.00 $40.00 $160.00
INCIDENTAL CONSTRUCTION
409.05.8 Remove and Reset Fence 8 L.F. $30.00 $240.00 $62.50 $500.00 $25.00 $200.00 $200.00 $1,600.00 $45.00 $360.00 $50.00 $400.00 $20.00 $160.00
409.18.2 42" Casing Installation 40 L.F. $450.00 $18,000.00 $600.00 $24,000.00 $720.00 $28,800.00 $586.00 $23,440.00] $1,195.00 $47,800.00] $1,093.75 $43,750.00] $1,500.00 $60,000.00
409.21.2 Repair Sprinkler Systems 1L.S. $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $550.00 $550.00] $1,755.00 $1,755.00] $1,000.00 $1,000.00] $5,250.00 $5,250.00] $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $500.00
WATER LINES
609.02.2 6" Pipe 80 L.F. $20.00 $1,600.00 $4.00 $320.00 $21.00 $1,680.00 $36.00 $2,880.00 $21.00 $1,680.00 $12.50 $1,000.00 $50.00 $4,000.00
609.02.2 16" Pipe 18 L.F. $50.00 $900.00 $4.00 $72.00 $54.00 $972.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $21.00 $378.00 $21.88 $393.84 $50.00 $900.00
609.02.2 24" Pipe 3100 L.F. $60.00  $186,000.00 $4.00 $12,400.00 $31.25 $96,875.00 $23.50 $72,850.00 $21.00 $65,100.00 $22.50 $69,750.00 $50.00  $155,000.00
609.03.2 6" Gate Valve and Valve Box 1 EACH $400.00 $400.00 $455.00 $455.00 $520.00 $520.00 $705.00 $705.00 $430.00 $430.00 $309.38 $309.38 $500.00 $500.00
609.03.2 24" Butterfly Valve and Valve Box 5 EACH| $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $625.00 $3,125.00 $600.00 $3,000.00] $1,186.00 $5,930.00 $785.00 $3,925.00 $515.63 $2,578.15] $1,000.00 $5,000.00
609.04.2 16"x6" Tee 1 EACH $500.00 $500.00 $350.00 $350.00 $800.00 $800.00 $445.00 $445.00 $870.00 $870.00 $608.75 $608.75 $500.00 $500.00
609.04.2 24" x 20" Reducer 1 EACH $700.00 $700.00 $550.00 $550.00 $500.00 $500.00 $275.00 $275.00 $630.00 $630.00 $468.75 $468.75 $500.00 $500.00
609.04.2 16" Sleeve 2 EACH $700.00 $1,400.00 $275.00 $550.00 $450.00 $900.00 $155.00 $310.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $331.25 $662.50 $500.00 $1,000.00
609.04.2 20" Sleeve 1 EACH $700.00 $700.00 $450.00 $450.00 $420.00 $420.00 $200.00 $200.00 $630.00 $630.00 $343.75 $343.75 $500.00 $500.00
609.04.2 24" Sleeve 1 EACH $700.00 $700.00 $550.00 $550.00 $420.00 $420.00 $300.00 $300.00 $630.00 $630.00 $406.25 $406.25 $500.00 $500.00
609.04.2 6" 45° Bend 5 EACH $400.00 $2,000.00 $175.00 $875.00 $520.00 $2,600.00 $150.00 $750.00 $455.00 $2,275.00 $287.50 $1,437.50 $500.00 $2,500.00
609.04.2 24" 45° Bend 4 EACH $800.00 $3,200.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 $358.00 $1,432.00] $1,390.00 $5,560.00 $781.25 $3,125.00 $500.00 $2,000.00
609.04.2 24" 22%° Bend 8 EACH $800.00 $6,400.00 $550.00 $4,400.00 $600.00 $4,800.00 $358.00 $2,864.00] $1,390.00 $11,120.00 $781.25 $6,250.00 $500.00 $4,000.00
609.05.2 Fire Hydrant 1 EACH| $1,500.00 $1,500.00] $1,700.00 $1,700.00] $1,000.00 $1,000.00] $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $630.00 $630.00] $1,031.25 $1,031.25] $3,000.00 $3,000.00
Salvage of Appurtenance - Type 16" Butterfly
609.07.3 Valve & Valve Box 3 EACH $400.00 $1,200.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $250.00 $750.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 $515.00 $1,545.00 $312.50 $937.50 $300.00 $900.00
Salvage of Appurtenance - Type 24" Butterfly
609.07.3 Valve & Valve Box 1 EACH $400.00 $400.00 $900.00 $900.00 $300.00 $300.00] $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $550.00 $550.00 $362.50 $362.50 $300.00 $300.00
609.07.3 Salvage of Appurtenance - Type 16" x 16" Tee 1 EACH $200.00 $200.00] $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $400.00 $400.00 $500.00 $500.00 $685.00 $685.00 $312.50 $312.50 $300.00 $300.00
609.07.3 Salvage of Appurtenance - Type 16" x 24" Tee 1 EACH $200.00 $200.00] $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $360.00 $360.00] $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $685.00 $685.00 $337.50 $337.50 $300.00 $300.00
609.07.3 Salvage of Appurtenance - Type 20" Plug 1 EACH $200.00 $200.00 $600.00 $600.00 $180.00 $180.00 $100.00 $100.00 $345.00 $345.00 $250.00 $250.00 $300.00 $300.00
TRENCH EXCAVATION AND BACKFILL
809.01.2 Trench Excavation and Backfill - Class | 17 L.F. $25.00 $425.00 $27.00 $459.00 $3.00 $51.00 $22.00 $374.00 $16.50 $280.50 $61.04 $1,037.68 $50.00 $850.00
809.01.2 Trench Excavation and Backfill - Class || 107 L.F. $30.00 $3,210.00 $27.00 $2,889.00 $3.00 $321.00 $22.00 $2,354.00 $16.50 $1,765.50 $61.04 $6,531.28 $50.00 $5,350.00
809.01.2 Trench Excavation and Backfill - Class IlI 2923 L.F. $40.00 $116,920.00 $24.00 $70,152.00 $3.00 $8,769.00 $27.00 $78,921.00 $16.50 $48,229.50 $61.04  $178,419.92 $50.00 $146,150.00
809.01.2 Trench Excavation and Backfill - Class IV 40 L.F. $50.00 $2,000.00 $70.00 $2,800.00 $3.00 $120.00 $200.00 $8,000.00 $16.50 $660.00 $61.04 $2,441.60 $50.00 $2,000.00
809.02.2 Unsuitable Material Excavation 200 C.Y. $20.00 $4,000.00 $21.00 $4,200.00 $18.00 $3,600.00 $15.00 $3,000.00 $54.00 $10,800.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 $20.00 $4,000.00
809.03.2 Rock Excavation 10 L.F. $100.00 $1,000.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $85.00 $850.00 $1.00 $10.00] $1,030.00 $10,300.00 $187.50 $1,875.00 $100.00 $1,000.00
809.04.2 Base Stabilization Material 200 C.Y. $20.00 $4,000.00 $42.00 $8,400.00 $22.00 $4,400.00 $20.00 $4,000.00 $28.00 $5,600.00 $50.00 $10,000.00 $40.00 $8,000.00
809.10.2 Removal and Replacement of Landscaped Areas 24 L.F. $20.00 $480.00 $27.50 $660.00 $40.00 $960.00 $100.00 $2,400.00 $50.00 $1,200.00 $50.00 $1,200.00 $200.00 $4,800.00
809.11.2 Removal and Replacement of Asphalt Plantmix ar 529 L.F. $20.00 $10,580.00 $68.00 $35,972.00 $85.00 $44,965.00 $74.00 $39,146.00 $27.00 $14,283.00 $91.06 $48,170.74 $40.00 $21,160.00
809.13.2 Non - Shrink Backfill Material 63 L.F. $40.00 $2,520.00 $130.00 $8,190.00 $76.00 $4,788.00 $112.00 $7,056.00 $92.00 $5,796.00 $156.25 $9,843.75 $100.00 $6,300.00
SPECIAL PROVISIONS
SP -1 Remove & Reset Sign 2 EACH $300.00 $600.00 $470.00 $940.00 $450.00 $900.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $450.00 $900.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $100.00 $200.00
SP -2 Mobilization 1L.S. $37,000.00 $37,000.00] $44,000.00 $44,000.00] $44,000.00 $44,000.00] $40,000.00 $40,000.00] $71,750.00 $71 ,750.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00] $47,000.00 $47,000.00
TOTAL $415,295.00 $238,949.00 $263,656.00 $309,392.00 $323,872.50 $428,960.09 $489,630.00

WTR-2016-32 Engr Est_YG_ADDENDUM 1 .xlsx
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MUNICIPAL SERVICES Municipal Services (208) 612-8249

City Clerk (208) 612-8415
IT Division (208) 612-8118
Finance Division (208) 612-8230
Treasurer’s Office (208) 612-8218

I DA HO FAL LS General Services (208) 612-84 3]

MEMORANDUM

TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM: Municipal Services Department
DATE: October 20, 2017

RE: Bid Award - IF-17-22 Parks Wayfinding

Attached is the tabulation for the above subject bid.

It is the recommendation of Municipal Services and the Parks and Recreation Departments to
accept the lowest responsive, responsible bids for the following sections. Funding is budgeted in

the 2016/2017 Parks General Fund operating budget and reviewed for carryover by the
Controller’s Office.

Section Vendor Description Total
I Eagle Sign & Design Fabricate Parks Signage $71,400.00
11 Landmark Signs, LLC Removal of Existing Signage and  $34,335.00

Installation of New Signage

Lump Sum Total Section I and I $105,735.00

Resp ctfully,

il

Pamela Alexander
Municipal Services Director

A.Z/-osz qi_/(«,uéu b sr——

ra Witt Heidi Carlson
General Services Administrator Purchasing Agent

P.O. Box 50220 | 308 Constitution Way | Idaho Falls, Idaho 83405-0220



Office of Purchasing Agent

CITY OF IDAHO FALLS

PO BOX 50220
IDAHO FALLS, ID 83405-0220
Phone 208-612-8433

Opening Date: October 3,2017

TABULATION BID IF-17-22

Fabricate and Install Signage and Graphic Elements

BIDDER 1. Creo Industrial 2. Eagle Sign & 3. Marq Architectural 4. Landmark Signs, 5. SignPro 6. 1E Sign 7. Graphic House
Arts, LLC Design Signs LLC Idaho Falls, ID Boise, ID Inc.
Woodinville, WA New Albany, IN Meridian, ID Idaho Falls, ID Wausau, WI
Section I — Fabricate
Signage — 37 signs $135,674.22 $71,400.00 $121,076.00 No Bid $116,212.24 $100,542.00 $137,525.00
Section I — Installation
Phase I - Removal of Signs No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,760.00 No Bid $15,185.00 No Bid
Phase II - Installation $29,575.00 $39,130.00
003547-C-4 12433-C-4

Idaho Public Works License



MUNICIPAL SERVICES Municipal Services (208) 612-8249

City Clerk (208) 612-8415
IT Division (208) 612-8118
Finance Division (208) 612-8230
Treasurer’s Office (208) 612-8218

MEMORANDUM

TO:  Mayor and City Council

FROM: Municipal Services
DATE: October 20, 2017
RE: Bid IF-17-23 Line Clearance Project

It is the recommendation of the Municipal Services Department and Idaho Falls Power along with
the Legal department, to reject all bids received for the Line Clearance project. The bidders did

not have a clear understanding of the evaluation process. Upon Council approval of the rejection
of bids, the Purchasing Division will re-bid the project.

Respectfully,

Sl Mg

Pamela Alexander
Municipal Services Dlrector

: a Witt \}'leldl Carlson

General Services Administrator Purchasing Agent

P.O. Box 50220 | 308 Constitution Way | Idaho Falls, Idaho 83405-0220



IDAHO FALLS

MUNICIPAL SERVICES Municipal Services (208) 612-8249

City Clerk (208) 612-8415
IT Division (208) 612-8118

Finance Division (208) 612-8230

MEMO

Treasurer’s Office (208) 612-8218
General Services (208) 612-84 3]

RANDUM

TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM: Municipal Services Department
DATE: October 20,2017

RE: Bid IF-18-D, Sole Source Purchase — Airport Security System

The Municipal Services Department requests authorization to advertise the City's intent to make a
sole source procurement following a 14-day period, as per I.C. § 67-2808, and then to issue a
purchase order for Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrade and Access Control Additions for
the Airport in the amount of $95,488.91, once the advertisement has been completed. The Sole
Source is needed to standardize the Airport Security System and was the recommendation from

the IT Division for integration of the current security system.

This procurement will be from Apex Integrated Security Solutions located in Garden City, Idaho.
Funds to purchase the software upgrade 1s budgeted in the 2017/2018 Airport Fund budget.

Respectfully,

Pamela Alexander &Z M

Municipal Services Director

/Z)WW J iy ( il e

Ctandra Witt Heidi Carlson
General Services Administrator Purchasing Agent

P.O. Box 50220 | 308 Constitution Way | Idaho Falls, Idaho 83405-0220



Modified: 10/4/2017

Revision: ‘ 0
Proposal #: APEX-2692
Account Rep: David Uli

Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access
Control Additions

ldaho Falls Regional Airport

2140 N. Skyline dr.
Idaho Falls, ID 83402

Presented By:

dpe.

Integrated Security Soluiions

Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc.

187 E. 50th Street
Garden City, Idaho 83714
208-378-9650
www.apexintegratedsecurity.com

This document is proprietary and confidential and is not to be copied or distributed without prior written approval from Apex Integrated Security Solutions
{AISS). This document is submitted with the understanding that it will be kept confidential befween the Client and AISS and will be returned to AISS
within 30 days if an agreement is not reached.


http://www.apexintegratedsecurity.com

This proposal includes labor and material to provide software, firmware and hardware upgrades to
comply with the current Hirsch Velocity compatible versions.

Proposal includes programming existing software version from 3.1 to current 3.6.

Proposal includes command & control module firmware upgrade and programming on 8 control panels.
The ninth contro! panel that needs to be replaced at gate #3 will come with a new CCM.

Proposal includes upgrading the existing (9) serial network interface boards on all existing panels to the
_current version SNIB3 control board. Hirsch tech support indicated the first in tine Hirsch panel can be
SNIB3 but all downstream communication boards need to be SNIB2 or higher to communicate back to
the SNIB3.

Proposal includes replacing the existing M2 Control Board at Gate #3. Board appears to be damaged
from electrical surge. Replace the control board only. New board will mount inside the existing cabinet.
Re-connect the existing lighting protector located inside the enclosure. Remove and retain all of the
original relays connected to the old M2 panel for future service repair parts.

Gate #3 has a wireless antenna that will need to be evaluated in the field to determine whether or not
the unit needs to be replaced with new one. Cost to be determined upon troubleshooting.

Proposal includes load testing all batteries. Cost to be determined upon load test and quantity of
batteries required.

Proposatl includes evaluating existing Hirsch panels wiring and report to customer any non standard
wiring practices found. Proposal includes a time and material cost for two technicians two days. Any re-
wiring required of panels will be evaluated and cost provided to customer before any corrections are
made.

Ground Level Additions or Modifications:

1) Baggage Claim Exit Door - Existing door has a card reader to exit and a push button to enter.
Remove push button and add card reader, mount in push button location. Tie new card reader into the
existing MRIB on Port B. Add cable from card reader to MRIB located above ceiling.

2) Entrance to Breezeway near game center - Add Hirsch Scrambleprox card reader, Remove old prox
card reader, Add new door contact and program for forced entry and door propped open alerts. Add
Hirsch MELM to supervise door contact. Add new cable back to headend.

3) Exit from Breezeway to Secure Tarmac- Existing door has card read in and out. Add new door
contact and program for forced entry and door propped open alerts. Add Hirsch MELM to supervise
door contact. Add cable back to headend. B
4) Back Two Sets of Double Entrance Doors at Gate 3 - Add new door contacts for forced entry and
door propped open alerts. Add Hirsch MELM to supervise door contacts. Add cable back-to headend.
Add New Card Reader to Enter Building from Tarmac on one set of double doors. Tie new card reader
into the existing MRIB on Port B. Add cable from card reader to MRIB located above ceiling.

© *Price Includes Accessories APEX-2692
Presented By: Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc. 10/4/2017
Project: Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access Control Additions Page 2 0f 10



5) Back Door to Airport Administration Office - Existing door has door contact and card readers on both
sides. Program existing door contact for forced entry and door propped open alerts. Add MELM in case -
there isn't one. No new cable, tie to existing cable and connect at panel.

8) Security Checkpoint Exit - Existing card reader and automatic door open. Add new door contact,
MELM and new cable back to main Hirsch headend.

7) Skywest Terminal Entrance to Back Area - Existing AD300 change card prox reader to card prox/pin
keypad. Existing AD300 lock is missing a door contact. Add new door contact and program for forced
entry and door propped open alerts. Door contact connects to the AD300 lock. Connect to existing
cable to lock that is tied back to PIM in communication closet.

8) Skywest Controller Room - Add card reader wall mount, electric strike, door contact, Hirsch MRIB,
Hirsch MELM, cable and cabling to existing Hirsch M2 contro! panel located inside this room. Connect
lock power to the exiting power supply panel.

9) Skywest Makeup Entrance - Add Scrambleprox card reader/pin keypad wall mount, electric strike,
door contact, Hirsch MRIB, MELM, cable and cabling to new Hirsch Controller, mount inside existing
Skywest Controller room.

10) Judah's Office Door - Add new wall mount card reader, electric strike, door contact for after hour
monitoring (no monitoring during business hours), new MRIB, MELM, and new cable back to main
Hirsch equipment room. Add New Hirsch Panel (no additional room on existing panel), Add new lock
power supply panel and back up batteries to both Hirsch Panel and Lock Power Panel.

11) Main Administration Door - Existing door has an electric strike and door release activation. Add
Card reader wall mount, door contact, MELM, cable and cabling back to headend panel.

Upper Level Additions or Modifications:

1) Jet Bridge Gate #2 to Ramp - Exisiting card reader on inside of door. Move card reader to otherside
of door. Add Scrambleprox card reader/pin keypad to inside of door. Tie new card reader to the exiting
MRIB port B. Add cable from card reader to MRIB located above ceiling. Add maglock to single door to
secure from entry. Add cable for lock power back to main lock power supply panels. Add new door
contact for forced entry and door propped open alerts. Add cable for door contact back to main panel.

2) Gate #2 Door to Terminal Waiting Area-~ Existing card reader to exit terminal, existing keyswitch to

override door alarm and push button tied to door alarm. Add card reader to enter into terminal waiting.
Tie new card reader into the exiting MRIB located above ceiling. Add new door contact DPDT and tie

into door alarm. Add MELM in case there isn't one. Add cable for door contact back to main panel.

3) Jet Bridge Gate #1 to Ramp - Exisiting card reader on inside of door. Move card reader to otherside
of door. Add Scrambleprox card reader/pin keypad to inside of door. Tie new card reader to the exiting
MRIB port B. Add cable from card reader to MRIB located above ceiling. Add maglock to single door to
secure from entry. Add cable for lock power back to main lock power supply panels. Add hew door
contact for forced entry and door propped open alerts. Add cable for door contact back to main panel.

4) Gate #1 Door to Terminal Waiting Area- Existing card reader to exit terminal, existing keyswitch to
override door alarm and push button tied to door alarm. Add card reader to enter into terminal waiting.

* Price Includes Accessories APEX-2692
Presented By: Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc. 10/4/2017
Project: Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access Control Additions Page 3 of 10



Tie new card reader into the exiting MRIB located above ceiling. Add new door contact DPDT and tie
into door alarm. Add MELM in case there isn't one. Add cable for door contact back to main panel.

All work proposed to be completed during normal business hours. Monday - Friday 8am to 5pm.

Proposal does not include network switches, routers, hubs, racks, etc. uniess noted in proposal.
Connectivity to these devices to be supplied by owner.

Proposal does not include data base repairs to the existing Velocity Data Base.

Proposal does not include any PC's or servers. Owner provided. Owner indicated a new workstation
will be provided with Win10.

Proposal does not include repair or replacement of existing hardware unless noted within proposal.

ADDITIONAL EXCLUSIONS AND CLARIFICATIONS
- All 120 VAC

- Lift Rental

- Patching and Painting

- Any material or labor not specifically listed as part of this proposal
- IP/LAN Address

- Premium Time

- Troubleshooting and repair

- Door recertification is excluded

- Network PoE switch.

- After normal hours, weekends, or holidays

* Price Includes Accessories APEX-2592 :
Presented By: Apex Integrated Security Solutions, inc. 10/4/2017
Project: Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access Control Additions Page 4 of 10



Qty Description Installed Price

Hirsch System Upgrades

Altronix AL600ULPDSCB

Model ALBOOULPD8CB power supply/ charger converts a 115VAC
60Hz input, to a 8 amp of continuous supply current @ 12VDC or
24VDC distributed via eight (8) PTC protected Class 2 Rated outputs.
Mode! ALB0OULPDS is a fuse protected version of this unit.

1 Apex APEX INSTALLATION LABOR #1

Apex Troubleshoot Labor: Battery Backup Load Testing

Apex APEX INSTALLATION LABOR #2

Apex Troubleshoot Labor: Evaluate Existing Control Panel Wiring

Standards

1 Apex APEX INSTALLATION LABOR #3
Installation / Termination Labor to remove and reinstall existing card
readers on upper level gates 1 & 2. install card reader on ramp side of
door.

1 Apex APEX INSTALLATION LABOR #4

System Evaluation of Current System Wiring on (9) Panels. Time and

Material Pricing not to exceed 2 technicians, two days.

Apex APEX PROGRAMMING LABOR

upe& .

o vl Programming Labor

—

—

Y

Y

Apex APEX STARTUP & COMMISSIONING
System Startup and Commissioning

3 HES 100610408

HES Heavy Duty Mortise Style Strike Body with Latch Bolt Monitor -
Rated for 1 Million Cycles

1 HES 100620571
E Faceplate Option - 630 Finish

7 HID 920PTNNEK00000-L001
iClass MultiCLASS SE RP40 Contactless Smart Card Reader, Wall

Switch .
8 Hirsch CCM-F
EaRRSCH Command & Control Module - Flash. Ships wiht version 7.2.03 or later
firmware,
' 4 Hirsch DS47L-SSP-HID-Hi
- ScrambleSmartProx DS47L-SSP-HID-HI. Install in high ambient light
- environments. 1MATCH connector with 6" pigtail. Use PIV I, DESFire
Transitional P1V, TWIC, FIPS 201-compliant CAC, MIFARE (CSN),
DESFire (CSN), iCLASS, and/or HID 125 KHz cards.
* Price Includes Accessories "~ APEX-2692
Presented By: Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc. 10/4/2017

Project: Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access Control Additions Page 5 of 10



Description Instalied Price

&

EHRaLE

14

Hirsch M2CB
Model 2 Controller Board Only

Hirsch MB9

Heavy Duty Slope Surface Mounting Box: Rear conduit entry. Includes
5/32 hex key and heavy duty gasket. 10 1/8"H x 8 1/8"W x 4"D.

Hirsch MELM3

3 inputs for Alarm/Door monitoring, alarm mask/RQE and tamper.
Enables Auto-Relock function on a

door. Includes 12" color coded flying leads. For installation within the
body of most alarm sensors.

Locate at door or device supervised.

Hirsch MRIB

MATCH Reader Interface Board accepts up to 2 readers & 2
ScrambiePads for dual technology entry & exit contro! of 1 door. Use
with CCM 6.4 (or higher) & CR readers (see DIGI*TRAC Manual for
compatible readers). 2 MATCH

connectors with 6" pigtails. Provides 5VDC @ 250mA reader power.
Mounting plate. UL Listed. CE.

Hirsch MX-8

Controls 8 Fully Supervised Doors. 4000 Useres, 8 door relays, 4 Alarm
Inputs (requires line modules),

enclosure, power supply, battery (7Ah), tamper switch, fock and
integrated SNIB2. Buildt in software configurable Wiegand interface for
direct reader connection, Supports Expansion Boards. Prequires
Velocity 3.5 SP1 or later for full functionality.

9 Hirsch SNIB3

2

Secure Network Interface Board Ilf - Networks DIGI*TRAC controller to
PC (with Velocity Version 3.6 SP1 or fater only) via 10/100/1000
Ethernet (TCP/IP). Optically isolated RS-485 port for multi-drop
between SNIB2s at baud rates up to

115K Bps. Supports AES (128 and 256 bit Rijndael) encryption between
host PC and Master SNIB3

and between Master SNIB3 and downstream SNIB2 or SNIB3. Master
SNIB3 supports integral XBox ’

functionality for globalization. Supports IPv6, DHCP and second
network port for future use, FICAM

enabled. UL listed.

Hirsch VEL-FDB-UPG31
Velocity Upgrade Services - Technical Support from 3.1 t0 3.6

Mier Products BW-106BP

Screw cover Continuous hinge Keyhole mounting Use with Mode! 3000
locks Available with (BW-106BP) with a removable back panel 12" x

12" x 4" Beige.
* Price Includes Accessories APEX-2692
Presented By: Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc. 10/4/2017 -
Project: Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access Control Additions Page 6 of 10



Qty Description Installed Price

1 Lenel LNL-CAM1

Lock assembly and keys for Lenel standard
cabinets.

27 Power Sonic IM-1270
12v 7A Hour Backup Battery

2 RCI1 8371DSSX28
8371DSS Mag Lock-Single-750 LBS-Door Status. Aluminum Finish.

1 RCISP71128
3/8" Spacer for 8371 Maglock

3 Schlage CS452550
Multi Tech Keypad, GREY PROX+SMART+KYPD MODULE,F/AD SE

10 Sentrol 1078C
}‘ 1078 Series 3/4" Stee! Door Contact
s 4 Sentrol / Interlogix 1076D-N
:5" The 1076D-N Steel DPDT Door contact is designed specifically for use
7

in the steel doors commonly found in commercial building applications.
The unique housing design features a rugged unibody construction with
flexible ribbed sides.

% 2250 Windy City Wire 442385
= ft - 18/4 Stranded Plenum

L. 500 Windy City Wire 444351-03
P ft - 22/6 Stranded OAS Plenum Data Cable

Cﬁ—j 1500 Windy City Wire NJ446100

D)
A »?(‘ Access Control Cables -Plenum. Individual lock power, door contact,

card reader, and request to exit cables into a single convenient
jacketless bundle

Hirsch System Upgrades Total: $78,168.91
Project Subtotal: $78,168.91

* Price Includes Accessories : APEX-2692
Presented By: Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc. 10/4/2017
Project: Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access Control Additions Page 7 of 10
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Miscellaneous Items

Qty Description Total Price
1 Shipping & Handling Fees $1,440.00
1 Travel & Lodging Fees $14,880,00
1 Misc. Contingency $1,000,00

Miscellaneous Total: $17,320.00

Project Summary

Total Installation Price: $78,168.91
Sales Tax: $120.96
Misc. Costs: $17,320.00

Grand Total: $95,609.87

* Price Includes Accessaries APEX-2692
Presented By: Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc. 10/4/2017
Project: Hirsch Velocity Software Firmware Upgrades and Access Control Additions Page 8 of 10



Standard Terms and Conditions of Sale

1. Agreement. The sale and provision of equipment and services {the “Project”} described in the proposal, to which this document makes reference below {the
"Proposal®}, are sold and provided by Apex Integrated Security Solutions, Inc. {*Apex") upon the following terms and conditions. These terms and conditions are
integral and shali govern all transactions with the customer identified below {the "Customer”} relating to the Project, as if the same were fully set forth in the .
Proposal. This document, together with the Proposal and the applicable Software Support Agreement, shall constitute the entire agreement {*Agreement")
between Apex and the Customer relating to the Project. Any attempt to amend or otherwise modify the terms and conditions of the Agreement by oral
representations or agreements, course of dealing or Customer documents, including without limitation any purchase order or similar document, is hereby rejected

and shall have no legal effect. Customer acknowledges that the Agreement was received and reviewed by Customer in advance of any document generated by

Customer.

2. Price and Terms. Prices quoted by Apex in the Proposal shall be binding for thirty {30} days from date of the Proposal. Payment terms are net thirty (30) days
from the date of invoice. Upon receipt of Customer’s signature on the Agreement, Apex may immediately invoice Customer for an amount equal to fifty percent
(50%) of {a) the cost of the entire Project, or (b} the cost of the equipment included in the Project, whichever is greater. Apex may delay commencement of work,
unless and until such initial invoice is paid in full. Upon completion of the Project, Apex shall prepare a final invoice; provided, however, that if the Proposal
provides for progress bilfing, Apex shall prepare interim invoices, in which case such interim invoices must be paid in full prior to Apex commencing the next phase
-of the Project. Apex hereby expressly reserves the right to deactivate or otherwise disable software installed as part of the Project, unless and until all outstanding

invoices are paid in full.

3. Taxes. Prices quoted in the Proposal exclude sales, use, excise and all other taxes, licenses, permits and other fees, unless otherwise expressly stated in the

Proposal. Any such taxes or fees imposed by local, state or federal taxing authorities shall be added to quoted prices in all cases, except where Customer provides
an appropriate tax exemption certificate. Customer shall be ultimately responsible for the payment of all applicable taxes and fees relating to the Project,

irrespective of whether the same are included in Apex’s invoice or not.

4. Limited Warranties and Limitations of Liability.

a. Equipment and Software. Equipment and software installed by Apex as part of the Project may b